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INTRODUCTION

These reports are intended for a general, nonspecialist audience. They run the gamut of
the arts and sciences, historical and current events, and should provide the reader with
useful  introductions  to  given  topics.  May  they  encourage  a  few  happy  hours  of
suggestive thought! 
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JOE BIDEN DECLARES WAR ON AMERICA

Time:  December  11,  1941.  Place:  the  Reichstag,  Berlin,  Germany.
Action: Fuhrer and Reichskanzler Adolf  Hitler  announces  Germany's  declaration  of  war  against
America.  The  declaration  was  handed  to  American Charge  d'Affaires Leland  Morris  by  German
Foreign Minister Joachim von Ribbentrop in von Ribbentrop's office. Declaration of war: a formal act
by which one state or actor announces war activity against another. The declaration involves the public
signing of a document by the actor himself or by an authorized representative. Less than a century after
a totalitarian regime declared war against a free society, a declaration of war has been signed by the
leader of this very society in an act of treason without precedent in the history of the free world. Less
than a century after Hitler declared war against America, this former global policeman of freedom has
collapsed from a stab in back delivered by its  president,  in an act  of moral,  spiritual and cultural
assassination which has defied the imagination of civilized people,  and this president has signed a
declaration of war against his own people. Less than a century after the leader of the Axis Powers
declared war against the leader of the free world, American President Joe Biden has signed a document
showing how far the cancer on the West has advanced. This cancer called communism, voted into
office in a landslide in the early twentieth century under a ticket marked progressivism, has advanced to
consume the highest office in the greatest land of liberty in modern times. It has advanced to consume
the office of the president of the United States, and on March 7, 2024, its present occupant, Joe Biden,
delivered a signed declaration of war against the nation, a declaration masquerading as a State of the
Union address. Mandated in Article II, Section 3, Clause 1 of the United States Constitution, which
states that ''the President shall from time to time give to the Congress Information of the State of the
Union,  and  recommend  to  their  Consideration  such  measures  as  he  shall  judge  necessary  and
expedient'', the annual State of the Union address was transformed on March 7 by Joe Biden into a
declaration of war by the electorate  and establishment  he leads against  two centuries of American
liberal democracy and the values of the Enlightenment which gave birth to the nation on the battlefields
of Lexington and Concord. Traditionally comprised of a report on the nation's budget, economy, news,
agenda, progress and achievements, the State of the Union address was perverted on March 7 by Biden
into the manifesto of an alien religion and the triple headed monster, marked Gender, Race and Class
Politics, which it has brought to life with the surging currents of hatred, fanaticism and discontent.
Look at Biden's travesty of a State of the Union message and hear him proclaim that a progressive
society walks away from and bows down to the forces of Islamist terror. Hear him proclaim that a
progressive society retreats from Afghanistan and surrenders its soldiers to the Taliban, along with
billions of dollars in state of the art military equipment. Hear him proclaim that a progressive society
has diplomatic and economic relations with the terrorist  dictatorships of China and Iran. Hear him
proclaim that a progressive society is a partisan society which divides people along gender, race and
class lines and discriminates against successful, white males. Hear him proclaim that a progressive
society has  weaponized its  law enforcement  authorities  against  the  national  leader  of  the  freedom
opposition, Donald Trump, criminalizing the exercise of his constitutional right to speak freely and
challenge the 2020 presidential election. Hear him proclaim that a progressive society has weaponized
its law enforcement authorities and sought to prevent Donald Trump from appearing on the ballot for
the  2024  presidential  election,  on  the  grounds  that  he  did  what  he  had  a  right  to  do,  and  led  a
insurrection against a regime which refused to provide redress against the 2020 presidential election
whose fraudulent character was recorded by eyewitnesses, surveillance cameras and mobile telephones.
Hear him proclaim that a progressive society licenses and foments black power violence under banners
marked Black Lives Matter. Hear him proclaim that a progressive society recognizes the religion of
transgenderism,  which  rejects  the  findings  of  science  that  DNA,  genes  and  their  chromosomes
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determine human gender, and proclaims that gender can be changed by human intervention or by a
simple declaration and belief  that one is  a  member of the opposite  sex.  Hear him proclaim that a
progressive society recognizes such a thing as transgender rights, enacts a transgender Equality Act, as
its president proclaims to psychotics who claim they are members of the opposite sex: ''I have your
back''. Hear him proclaim that a progressive society is an inflationary society which borrows and prints
money without  restraint  to  finance  social  welfare  handouts.  Hear  him proclaim that  a  progressive
society  has  an  open  borders  policy  which  has  allowed  eight  million  illegal  aliens  for
whom freedom and civilization are  unknown  words  into  the  nation.  Hear  him  proclaim  that  a
progressive society releases illegal aliens into the nation and allows them to settle far and wide. Hear
him proclaim that a progressive society grants asylum to these illegal aliens and allows them to commit
murder, mayhem, robbery and vandalism with impunity. Hear him proclaim that a progressive society
is  a  sanctuary  for  crime  committed  by  its  dark  avatars,  by  Marxists,  Islamists,  drug  gangs  and
degenerates of all stripes and varieties, a sanctuary which has expelled the voices of the Enlightenment
from its midst: ''In his Inaugural Address on January 20, 2021, President Biden promised that he would
reverse the 'state of chaos'  that Americans,  according to the president,  had experienced during the
Trump era. More than three years later, President Biden delivered his final State of the Union address
on  March  7 before  this  year’s  presidential  election.  He  criticized  his  predecessor  multiple  times,
without explicitly mentioning Donald Trump by name, in what sounded more like a no holds barred
campaign speech for Biden’s likely rematch against Trump than a typical State of the Union address.
'The state of our union is strong and getting stronger,' President Biden proclaimed midway through his
address, which began with a call for increasing US support for Ukraine. America did not even come
first in the constitutionally mandated State of the Union address that is supposed to be focused on the
state of this country. Russian President Vladimir Putin must have found it entertaining when President
Biden delivered this message early in his address that was meant for Putin: 'We will not walk away. We
will not bow down. I will not bow down.' President Biden walked away from Afghanistan when he
ordered the hasty retreat that devolved into chaos and cost thirteen American service members their
lives. President Biden left  Americans behind and abandoned billions of dollars of weapons for the
Taliban  to  use  or  sell.  He also  has  bowed  down to  autocrats,  especially  the  Chinese  and Iranian
dictators. 'I will always be a president for all Americans,' President Biden said towards the end of his
address, after shouting much of the time as he delivered the most divisive, partisan State of the Union
address in modern history. President Biden would have us believe that the American people are much
better  off  today than  they  were  during  the  Trump  administration  era.  The  truth  is,  however,  that
America  is  incredibly  weak  on  President  Biden’s  watch  at  home  and  abroad  because  of  Biden’s
disastrous  domestic  and  foreign  policies.  And  most  Americans  know  it.  Forty  three  percent  of
Americans surveyed in the most recent New York Times—Siena College poll responded that President
Biden’s policies are hurting them personally, while only eighteen percent responded that the president’s
policies are helping them personally. Only twenty four percent responded that the United States is on
the right track. President Biden promised to restore calm and stability, economic prosperity for the
middle class, and unity to America. He has portrayed himself as the guardian of democracy 'against all
threats foreign and domestic,' presumably including against his predecessor. Instead, President Biden
has presided over chaos, rampant inflation hurting the average American, unprecedented division, and
his own attack on democracy and core American values. President Biden’s State of the Union address
lasted a little over an hour. It took him about forty minutes before he addressed the issue at the top of
voters’ minds–the border crisis for which he did not take any responsibility himself at all. President
Biden falsely blamed Republicans for the illegal immigration crisis and mounting chaos that his open
border policies have created.'' (Biden's State Of Disunion by Joseph Klein). Time: September 2, 1945.
Place: the battleship USS Missouri. Action: Japanese Foreign Minister Mamoru Shigemitsu signs the
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Japanese Instrument of Surrender as General Douglas MacArthur's Chief of Staff, General Richard
Sutherland, looks on. A totalitarian regime, member of an Axis alliance along with the Third Reich and
Fascist Italy, surrenders to the arsenal of the free world. Less than a century after this shining victory,
the scene has been reorganized. The deck chairs have been reversed and the ship replaced. America has
surrendered to the forces of a new totalitarianism, marching under the banners of Marxism and Islam.
The ship is now named the Titanic and it is commanded by treason at the highest level, treason whose
name is Joe Biden.

EXPLOSION AT LOS ALAMOS

Its code name was  Trinity. It was mankind's first detonation of a nuclear weapon. Conducted by the
United States Army at 5:29 AM on July 16, 1945 at the Jornada del Muerto desert in New Mexico as
part of the Manhattan Project, it created an explosion equal to twenty five kilotons of TNT and sent a
blinding column of radioactive ash, dust and debris ascending into the heavens, stopped in its terrifying
flight only by the force of gravity, and then raining down poison upon the land never before seen in the
history  of  mankind.  This  blast,  this  turbulence,  this  vortex,  this  mushroom cloud,  produced  by a
weapon which would be deployed against Japan in August 1945, was preceded by another explosion
which  had  taken  place  over  a  period  of  seven  years,  commencing  in  1938.  More  massive  and
devastating than the nuclear fireballs which would hit New Mexico, Hiroshima and Nagasaki, this was
a  bomb  which  rained  down  treason  on  the  arsenal  of  the  free  world  and  would  handicap  its
commitment to freedom for all time to come. This bomb was detonated by a figure celebrated as the
father of the nuclear bomb. It was detonated by the director of the Manhattan Project's Los Alamos
Laboratory.  It  was  detonated by a  theoretical  physicist  who earned his  doctorate  in  physics at  the
prestigious University of Gottingen in Germany in 1927. It was detonated by a figure who became a
professor of physics at the University of California at Berkeley in 1936 at the young age of thirty two.
It  was  detonated  by a  figure  whose  achievements  in  theoretical  physics  included  contributions  to
research in electrons, positrons, nuclear fusion, wave phenomena, field theory,  neutron stars,  black
holes and cosmic rays. Defying the imagination of civilized people who could not conceive of an act of
treason so immense, an act committed against the leader of the Allied Powers during World War II and
against the nation which would be global superpower for freedom thereafter, an act committed in this
nation's  highest  scientific  circles  by  a  figure  whose  scientific  intellect  had  ascended  into  the
stratosphere  and  inspired  students  throughout  the  world,  this  bomb was  detonated  by one  Robert
Oppenheimer. Look at the career of Robert Oppenheimer and see a container filled with fire burst
across the Los Alamos Laboratory, across the nation, across the free world, and reduce the West to
smoke and ashes. See him serve as a member of the American Communist Party. See him serve as an
agent of the Soviet Union. See him serve as a scientist for the cause of communism. See him inform the
Soviets about America's program to develop nuclear weapons. See him provide access to the Soviets of
America's nuclear secrets. See him enable the Soviets to construct a bomb which would threaten the
free world as it had never been threatened before and cast a shadow of panic and fear across the lives of
decent, law abiding citizens: ''Comrade Beria, In accordance with your instruction of 29 September
1944, NKGB continues measures for obtaining more detailed information on the state of work on the
problem of uranium and its development abroad. In the period 1942-1943, important data on the start of
work in the USA on this problem was received from our foreign agent network using the contacts of
Comrade  Zarubin  and  Kheifitz  in  their  execution  of  important  tasks  in  line  with  the  executive
committee of the Comintern. In 1942 one of the leaders of scientific work on uranium in the USA,
Professor  Oppenheimer,  while  being  an  unlisted  member  of  the  apparatus  of  Comrade  Browder,
informed us about the beginning of work. On the request of Comrade Kheifitz, confirmed by Comrade
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Browder, he provided cooperation in access to research for several of our tested sources, including a
relative of Comrade Browder. Due to complications of the operational situation in the USA, dissolution
of the Comintern,  and explanations of Comrades Zarubin and Kheifitz on the Mironov affair,  it  is
expedient to immediately sever contacts between leaders and activists of the American Communist
Party and scientists and specialists engaged in work on uranium. NKGB requests the consent of the
leadership.  PEOPLE'S COMMISSAR OF STATE SECRUITY USSR Commissar  of  State  Security
First Rank, MERKULOV.''  (Letter from Boris Merkulov, Commissar for State Security, to Levrenty
Beria, Commissar for Internal Affairs, October 2, 1944. Top Secret, digitalarchive.wilsoncenter.org).
Look at the career of Robert Oppenheimer and see a dark trajectory of disloyality launched from the
depths of hell. See it mark out a rampaging monster: long term membership in the Communist Party of
the United States, long term membership in the communist underground and long term service as an
Soviet intelligence asset. Look at the career of Robert Oppenheimer and see a spy dedicated to the
Soviet Union. See the director of the Los Alamos laboratory direct treason against the nation. See a
pseudoAmerican place himself in the service of clandestine Soviet operations. See an accomplished
swimmer in the channels of Soviet espionage against America. See a Manchurian Candidate dangle
from the wires of the NKVD, the GRU and the international communist movement and conspiracy and
give to the Soviets  the knowledge they needed to do what their  religion commanded. This was to
construct a doomsday bomb and blast freedom into extinction: ''The Merkulov letter to Beria raises the
question of whether Robert Oppenheimer was a spy for the Soviet Union during the wartime period
when he directed the Manhattan project. The letter must be read in the context of Soviet intelligence
operations in the United States during World War II. Robert Oppenheimer's long time membership in
the Communist Party of the United States was made secret in 1942 because he was being used as a
Soviet intelligence asset by the communist underground to help obtain atomic secrets. Oppenheimer
was  being  run  through  the  American  Communist  Party  and  the  Comintern,  the  Communist
International, until 1944. Soviet intelligence decided that such operations were too risky because of
increased FBI surveillance of Communist Party operatives. At the time that Stalin acceded to President
Roosevelt's  request  and dissolved the Comintern in  1943,  Soviet  intelligence had to reorganize its
espionage channels in the United States. The letter addresses that problem, among others. The letter is
questioned by Gregg Herken, who wrote in Brotherhood of the Bomb, 'it is difficult to know whether
this cable is evidence of Oppenheimer's complicity or reflects the (understandable) desire of Kheifetz
and other NKVD operatives to curry favor with their boss.'  Gregory Kheifetz was operating under
cover as Soviet vice consul San Francisco from late 1941 to the summer of 1944. Herken argued in a
posting on H-Diplo: 'I suspect Kheifetz, who was recalled to Moscow in mid 1944, of padding his
resume by claiming that he had recruited Oppenheimer. Kheifetz's motive was simple: he was trying to
avoid execution for failure to perform while he was the NKVD's main spy in the Bay area.' Herken is
mistaken. Kheifetz was not recalled for failing to perform nor for inactivity. Nor was he sent to the
gulag. He was recalled because he was named in a secret letter to Stalin by an NKVD officer in the
Washington, DC rezidentura. He was accused of being part of a ring led by  rezident Vasili Zarubin,
supposedly working for the Germans and the Japanese. Stalin ordered them all recalled to Moscow to
investigate  the  charges,  which  were  dismissed.  The officer,  Lieutenant  Colonel  Vasili  Dimitrovich
Mironov, also sent an unsigned letter to J. Edgar Hoover, exposing the intelligence activities of the
Zarubins and Kheifetz, which the FBI named Anonymous Letter. The author of the letter to Stalin was
revealed only in 1994 by Lieutenant General Pavel Sudoplatov in his memoir Special Tasks. It is clear
from the contents that both the letters to Hoover and Stalin were sent by Mironov. Soviet intelligence,
furious at Sudoplatov for revealing a damaging secret, refused to confirm the story or make Mironov's
letter  to  Stalin  public.  Instead,  Soviet  intelligence  presented  the  disinformation  that  Kheifetz  was
recalled for 'inactivity'  and that Sudoplatov had not been in charge of atomic espionage during the
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critical period of World War II. This line, unfortunately, has been perpetuated by Herken, Amy Knight
and others.  See  the  chief  of  Soviet  nuclear  espionage in  America  inflict  untold  damage upon the
Manhattan Project. In fact, Kheifetz was cleared of the charges against him, promoted and given a
medal.  He  was  chief  of  section  of  Department  S,  atomic  espionage,  until  he  fell  victim  to  the
antisemitic purge of 1947. Mironov's letters to Hoover and Stalin hurt Soviet atomic espionage efforts,
but  by then the bulk of  the damage to the Manhattan Project  had been done.  Former intelligence
officers we interviewed in Moscow stressed that Oppenheimer's assistance was of great importance
during the 1942-1944 period. After that the question of who would run him and how he would be
contacted produced competition between the NKVD and GRU. Neither group succeeded because their
purpose was overtaken by events. By the end of the war the Soviets had what they needed to build their
own bomb and in 1946 Beria called an end to all contacts with American sources in the Manhattan
Project.'' (The Merkulov Letter by Jerrold and Leona Schecter, in  Was Oppenheimer A Soviet Spy? A
Roundtable  Discussion  by Jerrold  Schecter, Leona Schecter, Gregg Herken and  Hayden  Peake).  In
ancient Greek mythology, the Gorgons were three monsters, named Stheno, Euryale and Medusa, who
were able to turn people who looked at them into stone. A noiseless flash engulfs the sky. A sheet of sun
cuts through space. Then a thunderous roar the likes of which people had never heard before. Then
waves  of  heat  people  had  never  felt  before.  Then  particles  of  poison  to  which  people  had never
succumbed before. Then cities of rubble in which people had never been buried before. Then fields of
death people had never seen before. Fleeing on a dark beach and seeking sanctuary in the water, people
look back in horror and turn to stone. They have seen a holocaust unleashed by the enemies of freedom
under the direction of Robert Oppenheimer. 

JOE BIDEN'S GLOBAL RED THEATER

''In 1934 Orson Welles directed Macbeth for the Negro People's Theater, as part of the Federal Theater
Project. He also worked with John Houseman in the production of The Cradle Will Rock, a musical
by Marc Blitzstein. According to Houseman, it was 'a play with music (while others, at various times,
called it an opera, a labor opera, a social cartoon, a marching song and a propagandistic tour de force).'
Blitzstein wrote the play in only five weeks. The original production with Howard da Silva and Will
Geer  was  banned  for  political  reasons.  It  eventually  was  performed  at  the Mercury  Theater  (108
performances). Welles later recalled: 'Marc Blitzstein was almost a saint. He was so totally and serenely
convinced of the Eden which was waiting for us all the other side of the revolution that there was no
way of talking politics to him. When he came into the room the lights got brighter. He was an engine, a
rocket,  directed  in  one  direction,  which  was  his  opera--which  he  almost  believed  had  only to  be
performed to start the revolution.' '' (Federal Theater Project, Spartacus Educational). An engine for
communism.  A rocket  for  communism.  An  opera  for  communism.  Propaganda  for  communism.
Productions for communism. Songs for communism. A revolution for communism. A national march
for communism. Such was the Federal Theater Project, a project established by Franklin Roosevelt in
1935 as part of the New Deal, a project which would achieve infamy as the first government sponsored
theater program in the history of America to promote a religion dedicated to the destruction of freedom.
Less than a century after the Federal Theater Project broke dark new ground in proselytizing with
American tax dollars on behalf of the enemies of America, America's publicly funded red stage has
gone global and spread its terrifying Klieg lights into every nation on Earth. Look at Joe Biden's revival
of the Federal Theater Project on a global stage and see American political theater supplant the sounds
of freedom's song. See plays staged in African lands, financed by American taxpayer dollars, promoting
the religion of transgenderism. Emerging from the squalid womb of a Marxist nightmare known as
Gender, Race and Class Politics, transgenderism proclaims that what science has discovered to exist,
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DNA, genes and strings of genes called chromosomes, does not in fact exist, and what science has
discovered to exist, the genetic basis of gender determination, does not in fact exist, and gender can
instead be changed by human interventions or by a simple declaration and belief that one is a member
of the opposite sex. See plays staged to promote the rights of transgender psychotics. See plays staged
condemning  capitalism  as  a  system  of  violence  against  women.  See  plays  staged  condemning
capitalism as a system of environmental degradation. See plays staged condemning capitalism as a
system of  white  supremacy.  See plays  staged condemning capitalism as  a  system of  violence  and
exclusion  against  immigrants.  See  plays  staged  promoting  communism  in  the  name  of  African
democracy. See plays staged promoting communism in the name of hip hop and black culture. See
plays  staged  condemning  capitalism  as  a  system  which  deprives  people  of  their  rights  of  free
expression, free association, peaceful assembly and their right to access information. See plays staged
condemning  capitalism as  a  system of  discrimination  against  gays  and lesbians.  See  plays  staged
condemning capitalism as a system of bigotry, intolerance and cultural chauvinism. See plays staged
promoting discrimination against white males in the name of diversity. See the production of gender
theater, race theater, class theater, gay theater, lesbian theater, climate activism theater and illegal alien
theater,  and  the  funding  of  world  revolution  through  American  federal  grants:  ''The  Biden
administration is spending taxpayer dollars to stage plays in an effort to teach Africans about LGBTQ
rights. A State Department grant allocates money to 'improve communication at the level of the local
community on the social issue of LGBTQ rights and domestic violence via participatory theater' in the
African nation of Chad, according to a federal grant description. The Biden administration has paid out
several grants to use theater to educate foreigners about environmentalism, racism, immigration. The
grant was offered under the Africa Regional Democracy Fund, a State Department program intended to
support  the 'advancement  of civil  and political  rights,  freedom of expression,  association,  peaceful
assembly and access to information in African nations. The State Department approved an estimated
$26  million  in  grants  under  this  program during  the  2023  fiscal  year, according to  a  government
spending database.'The US Department of State supports a wide range of strategic programs to advance
US interests abroad,' a State Department spokesperson told the Daily Caller News Foundation. 'Culture
—from  music  to  sports  to  theater—is  a  vital  component  of  the  United  States’ people  to  people
diplomacy efforts in Chad and around the world and supports broader U.S. foreign policy goals,' they
continued. The US Embassy in Chad released a solicitation for grant applications under this program in
March 2022, stating that its  spending would help strengthen 'democratic institutions in subSaharan
Africa.' Teaching people in Chad about LGBTQ rights and domestic violence through theater will cost
American taxpayers $120,000, according to a federal grant listing. The grant was approved in October
2023 and will  carry on through September 2024.Biden’s State Department has made liberal use of
theater in pursuing its goals abroad. The State Department under Biden has paid to use theater and
dance  to  engage  youth  in North  Macedonia about  environmental  issues,  to  raise  awareness  about
immigration  issues,  to  teach  people  in Belgium about  'fighting  racism and  discrimination  through
theater' and to educate Bosnians about 'tolerance and intercultural cooperation,' federal grant listings
show. The department funded an 'ecotheater' production in Austria that touched on issues related to the
climate, according to a federal grant listing. Biden’s State Department has also supported other forms
of performance art abroad, including funding 31 different programs across 23 countries using hip hop
to assist climate activism and promote diversity, among other things.'' (Not Kidding: Biden Funding
Theatrical Productions To Teach Africans LGBT Rights by Robert Schmad). Look at Joe Biden's global
political  theater  and see communism promoted in  the  name of  democratic  norms,  institutions  and
human rights.  See communism promoted in  the  name of  protecting  women,  youth,  the  weak,  the
vulnerable and the marginalized. See capitalism condemned as a violation of fundamental freedoms.
See communism promoted as a system of citizen participation. See communism promoted as a system
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of  free  and  fair  elections.  See  the  rejection  of  meritocracy,  the  promotion  of  gender  politics,  the
establishment of affirmative action, and the setting of quotas for the placement of women in elected and
appointed offices. See the promotion of communist issues and the development of communist parties.
See  the  promotion  of  communism in  the  name  of  achieving  world  peace.  See  the  promotion  of
regimentation of journalism and the arts in accordance with the principles of political correctness. See
the rejection of liberal democracy and the promotion of local, national, regional and global communist
revolution:  ''The Political  and Economic Section of the US Embassy in  Chad is  pleased to  solicit
project proposals under the Department of State’s Africa Regional Democracy Fund (ARDF) grants
program, which provides limited foreign assistance resources to support programming that strengthens
democratic institutions in subSaharan Africa. ARDF grants support projects that address one or more of
the following objectives:  1.  Support protection from, mitigation of,  and responses to human rights
violations  and  abuses,  in  particular  human  rights  violations  affecting  the  most  vulnerable,  by
strengthening human rights frameworks, institutions, and oversight. 2. Support local and international
human rights organizations and institutions to promote human rights systems, policies and protection,
with a  focus  on women and youth.  3.  Strengthen the  capacity of  community based organizations,
including faith based organizations, and resident, vendor, or other associations, through civic education
and  citizen  participation  to  advocate  for  human  rights  and  democratic  norms  that  advance  public
involvement in civic life. 4. Support local civil society to hold government accountable for free and
fair, credible electoral and political processes. 4. Support throughout the electoral cycle, not only the
voting process, at the national or subnational level. Support could include providing assistance to help
increase the percentage of women holding elected and appointed national, regional, and local offices;
support for legislation that ensures fair processes; independent journalism on electoral issues; and issue
based political party development with civil society input. 5. Support to political processes, such as
peace processes and negotiations, which seek long term democratization and respect for human rights
and  accountability,  with  a  particular  focus  on  empowering  women,  youth,  and  marginalized  and
vulnerable populations.'' (Africa Regional Democracy Fund 2022, US Embassy Chad, usembassy.gov).
At Malaya Dmitrovka 6 in the Tverskoy District of Moscow stands the former site of Lenkom Theater,
also known as Lenin's Komosomal Moscow Theater. Named after Komsomol, the communist youth
league set  by Vladimir Lenin,  it  was the ''theater for working youth''  and disseminated communist
propaganda from the new Soviet stage. In 1935, communist public theater debuted in America in the
Federal Theater Project. Back by popular demand in the twenty first century, it has been delivering
encore performances throughout the world from public funds in Joe Biden's America. 

THE ASSAULT ON TRUTH

Sturmgewehr. Assault rifle. Adolf Hitler's name for a weapon developed in Germany during World War
II which made history. In 1943, the Sturmgewehr 44 burst onto the scene spraying mass death in the
form of automatic fire and would set the standard for infantry rifles throughout the world. For the past
one  thousand years  since  its  birth  in  Northern  Europe,  the  Faustian  culture  of  the  West  has  been
engaged in an assault far more deadly than the Sturmgewehr's  assault on the battlefield. This world
unique culture, whose fearsome symbol is the scholar and sorcerer Faust, avatar of a will to power
never before seen in the history of mankind, has been engaged in an assault on truth far surpassing the
mental destruction perpetrated in primitive cultures. As different from Classical Culture, whose prime
symbol was Apollo, avatar of reason and reality, as an early summer morning is different from a late
winter night, the West has promoted the doctrine of the relativity of truth on the pages of philosophy
treatises and made menticide the theme, aim and mission of its holy writ. Western culture is a Faustian,
romanticist,  relativist  culture,  and the  period  of  its  Age  of  Enlightenment,  with  its  philosophy of
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empiricism and objective  truth,  was an  anticurrent  and countermovement  to  the  general,  defining,
relativist trend. The first major assault on truth was fired by one of the citizens of the Enlightenment
who  lived  during  its  shining  glory  and  was  determined  to  bring  it  to  a  close.  It  was  fired  by a
subversive and fifth column operating within who sought to revive that which had been endemic in the
West prior to the Enlightnment, expel the alien Enlightenment concern for empiricism and objective
truth, join forces with the advancing armies of relativism, and return the West to its Faustian roots. His
aim was as clear and unequivocal as it was criminal and quintessentially Western: ''I have found it
necessary to deny knowledge in order to make room for faith.''  To deny knowledge:  a bold, brazen
assault on the mind never before stated with such shameless clarity in the history of mankind. To deny
knowledge: a frontal assault on man which defines mental sickness as nothing else does, and has tolled
out the death knell of human advancement. To deny knowledge: a declaration of war which would spray
out mass moral and spiritual destruction and bring civilization to a close, conducted in the only culture
in which it could have been conducted: in the world shaking, imagination defying, sanity breaching,
Faustian culture of the West.  I have found it necessary to deny knowledge in order to make room for
faith.  A clarion  call  to  sleeper  relativists  throughout  the  West  to  rise  up  and  overthrow the  alien
Enlightenment edifice of sanity in their midst and reestablish the West's native orthodoxy. This clarion
call was issued by the most influential philosopher in the West, by a philosopher who expressed and
systematized Faustian type thinking as no philosopher had ever done before, and would inspire two
centuries of relativistic philosophies, and launch the West on its downward trajectory into the abyss.
This clarion call was issued by Immanuel Kant, and his magnum opus, the Critique of Pure Reason, is
Satan's Bible of civilizational collapse. Listen to his doctrine and then listen to his latter day students
who  have  taken  control  over  the  twenty  first  century. Immanuel  Kant. Kant  proclaims  that  the
perceived world  of  physical  objects  in  space  and time  is  a  universal  delusion  produced by man's
perception. Socalled knowledge is acquired independently of all experience; it has no empirical basis;
and is on that account purely subjective and is knowledge of nothing. When man is conscious, he is
conscious of nothing, when man perceives something, he perceives nothing, and man is blind because
he has eyes and because he has a functioning visual system. A sense organ which functions properly
serves as a screen and veil over reality. The only true philosophy is that which is opposed to realism,
common  sense  and  ordinary  experience,  and  is  the  philosophy  of  transcendentalism,  apriorism,
idealism, relativism and subjectivism: ''I understand by the transcendental idealism of all appearances
the doctrine that they are all together to be regarded as mere appearances and not things in themselves,
and accordingly that time and space are only subjective forms of perception, not determinations given
for themselves or conditions of objects as things in themselves. To this idealism is opposed realism,
which regards space and time as something given in themselves, independently of our perception.''
(Critique of Pure Reason). Kant proclaims that true philosophy is that which acknowledges that man's
perception  creates  objects,  and  objects  do  not  create  perception,  as  common  sense  erroneously
maintains:  ''Hitherto it  has been assumed that  all  our knowledge must  conform to objects.  But  all
attempts to extend our knowledge of objects by establishing something in regard to them apriori have
ended in failure. We must therefore consider whether we may not have more success in the tasks of
metaphysics if we suppose that objects must conform to our perception.'' (Critique of Pure Reason).
The Twenty First Century. Now listen to Kant's latter day students follow in the footsteps of their
master and spray out automatic weapons' fire against the noblest activity pursued by man: the pursuit of
truth. Listen to them proclaim that because master Kant taught that all knowledge is relative to the
human race and there is no such thing as knowledge, there is no such thing as mathematics. Listen to
them proclaim that mathematics is subjective and partisan. The law that two and two equal four has no
relation to reality but is a product of Eurocentric bias and the patriarchal, white supremacist, capitalist
system.  People  who  believe  that  there  is  such  a  thing  as  a  science  of  mathematics  have  been
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brainwashed and programmed by the white, male, capitalist establishment. The notion that mathematics
is culturally neutral is a product of Western mythology. The notion that mathematics is an empirical
science endangers people's welfare and leads to environmental catastrophe. All attempts to construct a
science of mathematics have ended in failure because it is self evident that no knowledge of any kind is
possible.  The  science  of  mathematics,  impossible  and  inconceivable,  must  be  swept  away  by  a
movement  to  reestablish  sorcery  and  witchcraft  and  overthrow  Western  civilization:  ''A Brooklyn
College professor has said that the idea that math is objective or neutral is a myth. The math educator
Laurie  Rubel  also  tweeted  that  the  mathematical  equation  2+2=4  'reeks  of  white  supremacist
patriarchy'. She has also received support from several academics at universities and colleges across the
country who retweeted and promoted her claims. The tweets from Rubel are part of a trend on social
media  where  a  number  of  math  professors  and academics  from top  universities  have  debated  the
'Eurocentric' roots of American mathematics. 'The idea that math (or data) is culturally neutral or in any
way objective is a MYTH. I’m ready to move on with that understanding. Who’s coming with me?'
Rubel said in a tweet. While in another post, she added: 'Along with the 'of course math is neutral
because 2+2=4' trope and the related (and creepy) math is pure and protect math', this reeks of white
supremacist  patriarchy.  I’d rather  think on nurturing people & protecting the planet  (with math in
service of their goals).' She also recommended people to read about 'mathwashing' by posting a link as
well as writing, 'or read Cathy O'Neill's work @mathbabedotorg on Weapons of Math Destruction or
any or all of Rochelle Gutierrez's scholarship.' Harvard PhD candidate Kareem Carr supported Rubel
and tweeted: 'People say it’s subjectivism to ask if math is Western. I don’t get that. It’s an objective
fact that some groups were more involved in the creation of modern math than others. They may have
been  trying  to  make  it  objective  but  it’s  not  stupid  to  ask  if  they  actually  succeeded!'  Rochelle
Gutierrez, Maths Ed Professor, community activist,  frequent user of Creative Insubordination, said:
'YES!  This  attends  to  the  Cultures/Histories  dimension  of  mathematics  (addressing
Western/Eurocentric maths). And, we also want to attend to the Living Practice dimension (which is
more  about  imagining  a  version  that  builds  upon  ancestral  knowings,  but  does  not  yet  exist).'  ''
(2+2=4? New York  Professor  Says  Purity  Of  Math  Reeks  of  'White  Supremacist  Patriarchy’ And
Internet Loses It by Divya Kishore). Listen to today's neoKantians proclaim all truth is relative to time,
place,  tribe  and culture.  The  notion  of  empirical  science  is  a  product  of  racism,  imperialism and
capitalist oppression. The notion of universal, objective truth is a lash of discrimination against blacks,
indigenous people and people of color. Mankind must be liberated from the dogma that there is such a
thing as science and must return to the rule of faith and force: ''Abolition Science is an abolitionist
project that envisions a science and math delinked from racial capitalism, imperialism and oppression--
a science and math that serves all people. to undermine the racial capitalist logics of Western science &
math  that  necessitate  the  continued  exploitation  and  violence  against  land  and  BIPOC  (Black,
Indigenous, People of Color). 1. imagine and shape alternative math and science futures. 2. build a
collective community to shape a vision for liberation. 3. historicize science and math to understand
how it operates in the present. 4. be a resource for places of teaching and learning.'' (Abolition Science,
website). An echo chamber is a hollow enclosure built to produce reverberation. The sacred music of
the Christian Age was heard in the echo chambers of churches and cathedrals. The opera houses and
concert halls of the seventeenth, eighteenth and nineteenth centuries were designed as echo chambers.
The famous Hamilton Mausoleum in Scotland has the longest echo time of any building in the world.
The twenty first century has seen the construction of an echo chamber by students of the master builder
of  madness,  Immanuel  Kant.  This  is  an  ideological  echo  chamber  in  which  people  amplify  and
reinforce their preexisting psychoses. Kant set the stage for the construction of this unholy edifice.
Listen to the constant reflections of its sounds. There exists no absolute, universal, empirically derived
knowledge. All knowledge is relative to gender, race and class. Science does not exist. DNA, genes and
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chromosomes  do not  exist.  Males  can  become females  and females  can  become males  by human
interventions or by a simple declaration and belief that one identifies as a member of the opposite sex.
Science is a handmaiden of hatred and rage and should be deployed to support theories of doomsday
global warming which demand the dismantling of modernity.  Science is a handmaiden of old time
religion and should be deployed to prove that a one cell zygote at the moment of conception contains a
supernatural soul which makes it an actual human person, and that abortion is thus murder. The hard,
polished stones of this echo chamber were set into place by Kant's apprentices. The echoes within have
risen to thunderous roar and shattered civilization. 

AMERICA'S ANIMAL FARM

On August 17, 1945 in Britain, a book was published which would achieve international recognition
and success. It is a fable about a group of farm animals who rebel against their human master and seek
to create a society in which all animals are equal. But the revolution is betrayed by one of the animals,
by a pig named Napoleon, who proceeds to set up a dictatorship in which he enjoys special privileges,
and  the  farm reverts  to  the  state  it  had  been  in  before  the  revolution.  The  original  motto  of  the
revolution was All Animals Are Equal, but after the revolution, this was replaced by Napoleon with the
motto: All Animals Are Equal, But Some Animals Are More Equal Than Others. The book is called
Animal Farm and it was written by George Orwell, and it is the story of the 1917 communist revolution
in Russia. Before it was recognized as a modern classic in the late 1940s, the book was ignored and
suppressed across the West as being politically incorrect and offensive to communism and the Soviet
Union. Less than a century after it was first published, Orwell's masterpiece has taken on a new life. It
has assumed new meaning as a terrifying description of a nation exalted for a century as the leader of
the  free  world.  In  an  illustration  of  how far  the  moral  cancer  on  the  West  has  advanced,  George
Orwell's  Animal Farm serves as a story both of the former Soviet Union and the United States of
America in the twenty first century. It serves as a story of a nation which, two centuries after its birth
on the battlefields of Lexington and Concord, has descended into a Soviet system of two tiered justice
in which members of a ruling communist majority are exempted from the rule of law which governs
the anticommunist  minority.  Communism was voted into  power in  America  in  the  early twentieth
century in  a  landslide under  a  ticket  marked  progressivism. Since that  time,  it  has mutated into a
monster under the name of Gender, Race and Class Politics and embarked upon a rampage throughout
society, leaving no home, school, office or business unravaged in its wake. In America in the twenty
first century, this neoMarxist nightmare has brought to life the pages of Animal Farm and crushed the
voices of liberal dissent and the anticommunist opposition. In America in the twenty first century, a
communist majority and establishment have shredded the nation's constitution and burned down the
nation's house of freedom, built up with the blood and treasure of the soldiers of the Thirteen Colonies,
and set up a society of masters and slaves, devoid of the defining principle of the old America: the
equality of all people before the law. Look at the new America and see officials of the establishment
and  nobody else  allowed  to  commit  crimes  with  impunity.  See  John  Brennan,  an  official  of  the
establishment, lie under oath to Congress and state that drone assassinations conducted near Pakistan
did not produce collateral deaths, and state that the CIA did not illegally access Senate computers. See
him lie with impunity and see him appointed head of the CIA, and become a famous cable news
commentator. See him next lie while a news commentator and state that Donald Trump was a Russian
agent and that Joe Biden never ran a global influence peddling operation while he was vice president,
an operation established by a laptop full of emails and voluminous eyewitness accounts. See James
Clapper, an official of the establishment, lie under oath to Congress and state that the NSA did not
illegally spy on Americans. See him lie with impunity,  and see him become a famous cable news
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commentator  and  lie  again,  stating  that  Donald  Trump  is  a  Russian  asset.  See  an  official  of  the
establishment,  Eric  Holder,  defy  a  congressional  subpoena  with  impunity.  See  an  official  of  the
establishment, Andrew McCabe, tell serial lies with impunity under oath to Congress and to officials at
the FBI and Office of the Inspector General.  See an official  of the establishment,  Hillary Clinton,
violate the law by transmitting and receiving classified information over an unsecured private server,
and violate the law by destroying thousands of emails under subpoena, and do so with impunity. See an
official of the establishment, James Comey, lie 245 times under oath to Congress when he stated he did
not know or could not remember the FBI Crossfire Hurricane investigation of Donald Trump which he
had authorized, and do so with impunity. See him violate the law by retaining copies of classified FBI
memorandums containing conversations  with  Donald  Trump,  and violate  the law by leaking these
documents to a person without security clearance, and do these things with impunity. See an official of
the establishment, Joe Biden, unlawfully remove classified documents from the government and retain
them at his home and office, and do so with impunity. See an official of the establishment, Fani Willis,
obstruct justice, tamper with witnesses and commit fraud to conceal her illegal relationship with one of
her office colleagues, and do so with impunity. Now see the operation of a double standard without
precedent in the history of the nation. See the national leader of the freedom opposition, Donald Trump,
together with his staff, including Michael Flynn and Peter Navarro, jailed for crimes members of the
establishment were allowed to commit with impunity but which they themselves did not commit. See
them jailed not for what they did but for who they are. See them jailed, and along with them citizens
throughout the nation and people throughout the world, because they stood up for freedom. See them
jailed and see all people jailed, because when innocent people are jailed, no person is free, and see an
offense committed against innocent people, and a crime committed against all humanity, which will
live forever in the annals of infamy: ''In 2011, then Homeland Security Advisor to President Obama,
John Brennan, swore before Congress that drone targeted assassination missions near the Pakistani
border had not led to 'a single collateral death.' That was an obvious lie with grave consequences, given
that  Brennan was  sworn under  oath  and was  one  of  the  top  officials  in  the  US national  security
community. Yet there were no subsequent repercussions. In fact, the opposite occurred. Brennan was
subsequently  rewarded  with  a  2013  appointment  as  CIA Director.  But  the  next  year,  once  again,
Brennan lied to Congress, assuring the Senate Intelligence Committee that his CIA had not secretly
accessed senate staffers’ computers. Again, there were no consequences for his repeated lies. Instead,
Brennan,  upon retirement,  went  on to  be an MSNBC/NBC analyst  who helped to  promulgate  the
Russian  collusion/laptop  disinformation  hoaxes.  In  2013,  Director  of  National  Intelligence  James
Clapper also lied under oath to Congress when he laughably stated that the National Security Agency
did not spy on American citizens. Later, when called out by senators, Clapper fudged in a televised
interview. 'I responded in what I thought was the most truthful, or least untruthful, manner by saying
no.' Try that contortion with the IRS. Some members of Congress referred a criminal complaint of
perjury against Brennan to then Attorney General Eric Holder. Nothing happened. Again, one of the
chiefs of the American national security community was exempted after lying to members of Congress.
Clapper went on to a lucrative position as a CNN national security analyst, and at one point he claimed
that Trump was a Putin asset. As far as Eric Holder, he had earlier defied a congressional subpoena and
was held in contempt by the House. The Department of Justice,  however,  chose not to pursue the
complaint. Later in the Trump administration, Trump adviser Peter Navarro would be sentenced to four
months  in  jail  for  similarly  resisting  a  congressional  subpoena.  Was  it  a  crime  or  not  to  resist  a
congressional subpoena? The Justice Department’s Inspector General concluded that Andrew McCabe,
the  former  FBI  deputy  director  and  interim director,  had  lied  repeatedly  to  a  variety  of  officials,
including FBI Director James Comey, various FBI agents, and officials of the Office of the Inspector
General. On some of these occasions, McCabe was sworn under oath. Yet in 2020, the Department of
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Justice chose not to pursue the IG’s criminal referrals. McCabe went on to become an outspoken CNN
News contributor. Note that General Michael Flynn, Trump’s National Security Advisor, was indicted
—and convicted—for similarly lying to the FBI in 2017. In 2016, an FBI investigation found that
Hillary Clinton, as Secretary of State, had violated the law by transmitting and receiving classified
information over an unsecured private server. Subsequently, she destroyed thousands of emails and
some devices, some of which were under subpoena. Our criminal justice system no longer treats the
accused equally under the law. If the defendant is deemed a conservative, like a Michael Flynn, Peter
Navarro, or Donald Trump, then the full force of prosecution falls upon them. But if a Biden, Brennan,
Clapper,  Clinton,  Holder,  or  Willis,  then  the  state  contorts  itself  to  find  excuses,  exemptions,  and
mitigating circumstances not to pursue justice—and so often to the point of absurdity and the erosion of
Americans’ confidence in their laws. In these high profile cases in this polarized era, a cynical public
now expects any accused prominent leftist to remain unindicted, while any non leftwing target will be
indicted, convicted, and jailed—for the same alleged offenses.'' (Guilty!—But Not Really Guilty? By
Victor Davis Hansen). In George Orwell' allegory, the animal revolutionaries called the system they
established Animalism. This was another name for communism. In the twenty first century, another
synonym has been added, descending into a disgrace never before seen in the history of mankind: One
Hundred Percent Americanism. 

RAMADAN DARKNESS DESCENDS ON EUROPE

It is derived from the Arabic word  ramida,  which means  burning, scorching, blazing, glowing  and
intensely hot. It begins on the last night of the month of Shaban and ends on the last night of the month
of Ramadan, between the first and last sightings of the crescent moon. The holiest time in Islam, it is a
month of hatred and fanaticism as white hot as they are blind and unthinking. It is called Ramadan and
in  the  twenty  first  century,  this  month  of  fasting,  prayer,  reflection  and  solidarity  among  the
Community of the Faithful has blotted out the sunlight of freedom in Europe and spread darkness, the
darkness of fear and control, across the land. The gate to this darkness, to this Pillar of Islam, to this
name for Allah, to this Ramadan was opened by a fifth column operating within Europe. It was opened
by the agent of an international movement and conspiracy whose armies have taken control of the
West. It was opened by a cancer in its final stages of development which has spread into every sector of
society. It  was opened by a  monster  on a  rampage,  assembled and brought  to  life  by the  surging
currents of a religion elected to high office in a landslide, under a ticket marked progressivism, in the
early years of the twentieth century, a religion which presently defines the Western establishment. This
religion was founded by Karl Marx in the nineteenth century;  it  originally peddled class war;  but
emerging from a laboratory manned by Marx's assistants in the twentieth century, it mutated into a
nightmare called  Gender, Race and Class Politics and breathes fire into every family, home, school,
office and business.  In  the  twenty first  century,  it  has  formed an alliance with  another  movement
opposed to freedom. This movement is the second religion dominating the world. It was born in the
deserts of Arabia and is called Islam. It too was elected by the people in a landslide and defines the
establishment  in a  swathe of  nations across the East.  The Gender,  Race and Class monster  which
controls Europe has let into the continent the Eastern movement of Islam to assist it in its mission to
destroy civilization.  These fearsome movements  have launched a double barrel  assault  against  the
traditions and institutions of the Enlightenment, and sent the story of the West hurtling into the abyss.
Two popular movements, one from the East and one from the West, both dedicated to the destruction of
freedom, have joined forces and assumed control over the world, and in Europe, in the birthplace of
freedom, they have reversed the Battle of Tours, won by the West in 732 which stopped the advance of
Islam,  and set  into  motion  a  process  of  Islamification  which  has  made the  birthplace  of  freedom
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unrecognizable.  Europe today bears no resemblance to the Europe of yesteryear.  Europe today lies
prostrate beneath the whip hand of two masters, Marxism and Islam, and rendered bloodied and lifeless
beneath their relentless lashes, it has acquired a new calendar and a new method of keeping time. In
Europe today, every day is a day of hate, every month is the month of Ramadan, and the passage of
time is marked, not by the movements of a clock, but by the number of smashed windows, burned
down buildings, torn up cities and dead bodies increasing. Europe today is Islam; it is Ramadan; it is
one thousand years of freedom annulled; it  is  the final chapter of a story of treason composed by
Marxists  which  has  made  darkness  descend  on  the  continent. Europe  today. The  holy  land  of
Ramadan, the holy books of the faithful, the holy mosque of the prayerful and the holy city of Mecca.
Europe today. The community of Allah's most faithful and fanatical followers, swords unsheathed and
ready to kill. Europe today. The voices of reason, enlightenment and the infidel crushed and silenced
forever.  Europe today. The rule of Islamist governments, Arab governments, and their war against
Israel and the West. Europe today. Bombings, stabbings, stone throwings and rocket attacks launched
against the Jewish redoubt of freedom in the Middle East.  Europe today. ProHamas marches for a
holocaust demanding the extermination of Jews.  Europe today.  The sacrifice of liberal democratic
norms and values before the gangster law of Sharia. Europe today. The house of the Quran, the house
of bigotry, the house of intolerance and the house of war.  Europe today.  The rule of the family, the
family of  sons  and daughters  of  Allah  and the  One True  Faith,  displacing  the  rule  of  courts  and
constitutions which once protected human rights.  Europe today. Subjugation and servility before the
decrees of the Prophet in Heaven. Europe today. Ramadan lights blaze in city halls and Hamas flags
festoon their rooftoops, beckoning passersby to convert to terror.  Europe today. Streets named after
Islamists and governments enforcing Islam at the point of a gun. Europe today. Socalled conservative
parties reject freedom and place mayors and city councils in the service of Islam. Europe today. Illegal
migrants allowed to spread a plague in the form of an alien religion and allowed to overrun cities in the
name of achieving inclusion and diversity.  Europe today.  Eyes dazzled and blinded by spectacular
fireworks  displays  spelling  out  the  subversion  of  once  free  nations.  Europe  today. Unclean,
unpleasant, a veritable sewer of ignorance and superstition, a bloody field of riots and demonstrations,
am ideological  echo chamber  patrolled  round the clock by thought  police,  a  continent  without  an
enclave of freedom remaining: ''Well, it’s that time of year again: the Holy Month of Ramadan, when
one of the holiest things you can do is to grab a copy of your Holy Book, fly to the Holy City of Mecca,
make your way to the Holy Mosque (Al Masjid Al Haram), fall to your knees, and pray with all your
mind and heart and soul for the extermination of the infidel. To be sure, many of Allah’s more fervent
believers,  having carefully perused the words of His Holy Book, recognize that prayer in itself  is
woefully insufficient, and that in order to properly celebrate this holiest of months it is necessary to act
upon the Holy Book’s injunctions that they do their own part to bring about the infidel’s consummate
and unmitigated destruction. So it is that in 1973, Egypt, Syria, and eight other Arab governments took
the occasion of Ramadan to launch the Yom Kippur War against Israel. In 2016, the Pulse nightclub
shooting in Orlando, in which the jihadist Omar Mateen killed 49 people and wounded 53, occurred
during Ramadan. When the Holy Month came around in 2022, Palestinians were once again motivated
to up their game, subjecting the people of Israel to a series of devastating rocket attacks as well as
dozens of stabbings, bombings, and other sacred activities. And during last year’s Ramadan, some of
the most pious of Muslims launched rockets inteo Israel from every direction–Gaza, Lebanon, Syria–
while equally devout rioters waving a Hamas flag occupied the Temple Mount and threw stones at Jews
who were engaged in prayer at the Wailing Wall, probably for peace on earth and good will toward
men. Suckers! Which brings us to the present day. You might say that this time around, Hamas started
its Ramadan celebration a few months earlier, namely on October 7. Since that day, alas, Israel has
made things  rather  tough for  the Prophet’s  ardent  followers  in  Gaza.  The other  side  of  that  coin,
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needless to say, is the proliferation of pro Hamas marches that have taken place weekend after weekend
in the streets of major cities all over the part of the world that--still  governed (for the time being,
anyway) more or less in accordance with Western democratic norms instead of being subjected to the
harsh tenets of sharia law--is designated by the Koran as the House of War. In those marches, the sons
and daughters of Allah have been joined by individuals who, while not yet converts to the True Faith,
are patently eager to demonstrate their willing subjugation to it. Surely Allah, in his Heaven, is smiling
down on these acts of pure servility. But these marches aren’t the only way in which compliant infidels
are announcing to the world their deference to Islam. This year, for the first time, the city of Oslo,
Norway,  is  commemorating  the  month  of  Ramadan  with  a  spectacular  public  display of  brilliant,
twinkling lights in the shape of half moons. These lights have been placed around Oslo’s City Hall
(where, a few weeks ago, passersby could see a Hamas flag flying proudly) and along a couple of
neighboring  streets.  Those  streets,  as  it  happens,  are  named  for  two  of  the  most  distinguished
Norwegians of all time–Roald Amundsen, who led the first teams to reach both the South and the North
Pole, and Fridtjof Nansen, who was also a major explorer (leading the first team to cross Greenland),
but who won even greater distinction as a diplomat, playing a key role in the peaceful separation of
Norway from Sweden and introducing the 'Nansen passport' for persons left stateless after World War I.
Neither Amundsen nor Nansen was a Muslim (Amundsen was a devout Christian who, during his
perilous polar expeditions, felt he was entirely in God’s hands; Nansen was an atheist), but no doubt the
names of these streets will, in the fullness of time, be changed to honor Muslims who have played key
roles in Norway’s Islamization. '' (Europe's Ramadan by Bruce Bawer). Turkey. Iran. Dubai. Indonesia.
Syria. Somali. Saudi Arabia. The train of Islam winds it way around the world, taking on board true
believers,  darkening the  skies  with  the  smoke of  revolution,  and crashing through the  citadels  of
science and sanity. Its last stop is Europe at the end of time. 

BLACK FUHRER TURNED LOOSE 

The principles of assembly are these: (1) Place the tools and the men in the sequence of the operation
so that each component part shall travel the least possible distance while in the process of finishing.
(2) Use work slides or some other form of the carrier so that when a workman completes his operation,
he drops the part always in the same place—which place must always be the most convenient place to
his hand—and if possible have gravity carry the part to the next workman for his own. (3) Use sliding
assembling lines by which the parts to be assembled are delivered at convenient distances.  (My Life
And Work by Henry Ford). The assembly line. A manufacturing process in which parts are added as the
semifinished product moves from workstation to workstation, and the parts are added in sequence until
the final product is produced. The assembly line. A sequential organization of workers, parts, tools and
machines designed to produce products with maximum efficiency. Commencing operation on October
7, 1913 at the Highland Park Ford Plant in Michigan, the assembly line produced Model T automobiles
faster than their paint dried and transformed the world of manufacturing. Five decades after the Ford
assembly line began producing automobiles at a rate never before seen, another assembly line was
established which transformed the world of politics, and for the first time in history, inflicted mass
produced destruction on mankind. While Henry Ford was the father of the industrial assembly line, the
father of the political and ideological assembly line was a nineteenth century theologian born in Trier,
Germany. He invented a monster called Tribalism and told his workers how to augment it as it moved
through workstations of hate. The first version of this monster was called Class Hate and it declared
war on successful people from all walks of life, from business to philosophy to science to technology to
engineering to the arts, branding them as the bourgeois enemies of the proletariat, the working class,
and calling for their extermination. This inventor's name was Karl Marx. A century and a half after he
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taught his students how to augment and mass produce a monster, his assembly line finally commenced
operations in the mid twentieth century,  powered by the forces of civilizational collapse, when his
monster received its first and second augmentations. These were the politics of feminism and black
power, and they called for the extermination of males and whites, respectively, and created a sweeping
vortex of violence never before seen in the history of mankind. The finished product, called Gender,
Race and Class Politics, achieved the dark vision of Karl Marx and was an immense success with the
masses. It moved like a cancer across the West, spread into every sector of society, broadcast its hymns
of  hate  in  classrooms,  courtrooms,  corporate  suites  and  cabinet  offices,  and  brought  the  story  of
civilization to a disgraceful and terrifying finish. This monster is a three headed Gorgon which has
turned the traditions and institutions of the Enlightenment, the foundations of freedom in the modern
world, into ashes and stone. In the city of College Park, Maryland, a short six kilometers away from the
nation's capital, and the home of the flagship campus of the prestigious University of Maryland, a scene
of civilizational collapse is on display in spectacular fashion, and has already been inscribed on the
tombstone of the West. In the city of College Park, a neoMarxist avatar of mental illness has spread
panic and fear in the streets. Listen to Kayla Aliese Carter proclaim that a progressive university is a
radical university whose campuses are battlefields, whose classrooms are war rooms holding race war
sessions, and whose professors indoctrinate students in the necessity to abolish freedom. A progressive
society  has  established  a  policy  of  discrimination  against  whites  in  the  name  of  racial  equity.  A
progressive society is a black socialist society which has burned down capitalist America and set fire to
its white inhabitants in the name of black liberation. A progressive society is a black welfare society
which has abolished the need for blacks to work by subsidizing them with money stolen from whites. A
progressive society is a revolutionary society which has reduced whites to the status of chattel slaves of
blacks. A progressive society is a violent society which has corralled whites into Warsaw ghettos and
opened fire. A progressive society is ruled by black anger and rage against the capitalist system. A
progressive  society  is  governed  by policies,  programs  and  practices  which  excludes  whites  from
neighborhoods, schools, work forces and from the human race. A progressive society has abolished the
right of free speech and enforced adherence to the black communist party line. A progressive society
has abolished liberal democracy on the grounds that it is a reactionary system and replaced it with a
regime of black bias and disenfranchisement of whites. A progressive society has abolished liberal
democracy on the grounds that it is a colonialist system and replaced it with a regime of black fascism.
A progressive society condemns capitalism on the grounds that it  oppresses and exploits blacks. A
progressive society judges people by the color of the skin and not the content of their character and is
an  affirmative  action  regime  which  gives  preferential  treatment  to  blacks.  A progressive  society
condemns capitalism on the grounds that it  is  a system of white supremacy.  A progressive society
encourages blacks to support themselves by rejecting honest work and by begging, stealing and selling
drugs. A progressive society excuses all forms of criminal conduct perpetrated by blacks. A progressive
society is a police state goosestepping to the drumbeats of black power. A progressive society is a
regime of persecution of the voices of freedom, voices led by Donald Trump, which defunds them,
detonates them, strangles them and shoots them down in cold blood. A progressive society is a social
media platform which relentlessly attacks anticommunists, incites violence against them, plans for the
destruction of civilization,  and has launched a holocaust  against  the white  population:  ''There is  a
controversy brewing in the City of College Park, Maryland over its 'racial equity' leader Kayla Aliese
Carter,  who  is  tasked  with  eliminating  systemic  racism in  the  departments  of  the  liberal  [leftist]
city. Carter has called for the United States to be burned down to allow for 'Black Liberation.' The city
says that it is investigating, but Carter is an interesting snapshot of what I have called the radical chic in
academia and society. She is a revolutionary who called for violence while complaining that she is
being asked to work for a living. In addressing the controversy, the City of College Park will now need
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to establish a free speech principle that will apply equally to revolutionaries and reactionaries alike.  In
2022, Carter joined the city workforce under Mayor Fazlul Kabir to implement a 'racial equity' agenda
across  all  city  departments,  affecting  policies,  practices,  programs  and  budgets.  Under  Kabir’s
leadership, she was to work on reviewing 'all current policies and programs' for any bias and 'disparate
impact  for  black people.'  Carter  however  appears  to  prefer  arson to  analysis. She has  long voiced
violent and racist views. She helps guide fellow armchair revolutionaries on 'how we will eat and live
and grow after we burn it all down.' She has little patience with incremental changes and calls for
others to 'dismantle this shit.' Carter maintains that it is only the destruction of society that will result in
true justice: 'I can’t wait for society to collapse so MY ideology can rise from the ashes!' She also
rejects criticism of violence, asking 'Why do black people always have to rationalize our violence and
anger?' After all, she noted on Instagram, 'we are at war against colonialism.' She has posted on how
she has facilitated and cohosted events with people committed to her view of black liberation. In these
public statements, she repeatedly rejects calls for nonviolence in seeking the destruction of society: In
one May 2020 post, she asked 'Do you all understand why the oppressed are constantly shamed out of
using  violence?  BECAUSE  THE  OPPRESSOR  WANTS  TO  BE  THE  SOLE  PROFITEER  OF
VIOLENCE. THEY DON’T WANT TO DEAL WITH BACK TALK. ‘DO AS I SAY NOT AS I DO’
No.' Using yT for white people, she even slammed those who tried to be inclusive at work: 'This yT
man in my meeting just said, ‘I want to take a moment and give the floor to any black participants to
tell us what MLK Day this year meant to you.’ I SWEAR. I AM WHEEZING. WHO HIRES THESE
PEOPLE?' While working at one of the most far left governments in the country, she portrays her life
as working within a system of white supremacist oppression. In one posting, she added at the end
'White man calling, I got to go.' While the Kabir administration pays her $75,600, she is not happy with
having to work to feed herself due to this white supremacist, capitalist system. Instead, she posts how
she should be a 'collage artist' or a 'lady of leisure.' However, her preferred job description may not
resonate with employers outside of the City of College Park government: 'I need a new job but the
problem is that I don’t want to work. I just want to lie in my bed being a girl. Can anyone help me with
this?' Yet, she says capitalism is to blame for forcing her back into criminal conduct: 'Tired of being so
underpaid, and also tired of applying to new jobs. I don’t want to go back to selling drugs but this
economy is getting desperate.' '' (College Park Under Fire Over Self Professed Revolutionary 'Racial
Equity' Leader by Jonathan Turley). Kayla Aliese Carter is a phantom from another time, a nightmare
resurrected from the Third Reich with only the colors of the flags, shirts and armbands changed, a
twenty first century fuhrer straight off an assembly line first set up by Karl Marx. She roams the world,
from London to New York to Paris to Los Angeles, and stays alive because the electricity of gender,
race and class politics keeps her alive. These Marxist currents of hate have incinerated civilization. 

CLASS WAR USA

On April 9, 1917, a sealed train carrying a virus set off from Zurich, Switzerland. This virus was a
movement and conspiracy known as communism and its operations were directed by Vladimir Lenin,
leader  of  the  Russian  Bolshevik  Party.  On  April  16,  1917,  the  train  arrived  at  its  destination  in
Petrograd  and  Lenin  took  control  of  the  burgeoning  communist  movement  in  the  country.  On
November 7, 1917, Lenin led an armed insurrection at the Winter Palace in Petrograd, overthrew the
liberal government of Alexander Kerensky, and abolished freedom in Russia.  The New York Times
headline  of  November  8  reports  on  the  outbreak  of  a  cancer  which  would  spread  far  and  wide:
Extremists Rise To Power In Russia. From The Outset of Revolution, They Have Thwarted Efforts Of
Moderate Governments. Sapped Kerensky's Rule. The communists staged a totalitarian coup, ignited
communist movements across Europe, Asia, Africa and the Americas, and created a day which would
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be celebrated by the enemies of freedom throughout the world: November Revolution Day. In a stark
illustration  of  how far  the cancer  of  communism had advanced,  Lenin's  revolution  swept  into the
arsenal of the free world in the 1930s, and in tickets marked  Progressivism and a  New Deal, it won
power in a landslide. The people of the United States of America voted to establish communism as their
state religion, and inaugurated the succeeding, final red decades of the nation, which would dig the
nation's grave in the twenty first century. In addition to Progressivism and a New Deal, communism has
had many names in America. It has been peddled in a veritable alphabet soup and Scrabble board of
new word combinations, peddled as New Frontier, Great Society, Centrism, Third Way, A Kinder and
Gentler Nation, Compassionate Conservatism, Yes We Can, Change We Need, Hope, Build Back Better
and Let's Finish The Job. A synonym and byword for the American establishment, communism has
composed the epitaph of the nation, inscribed on a tombstone of treason and disgrace. In the twenty
first century, it has rendered the former arsenal of the free world morally, spiritually and politically
unrecognizable. Look at America today and see the expropriation of successful people with a rifle blast
called a wealth tax. See the construction of a Berlin Wall to prevent successful people from leaving the
nation to escape expropriation, a wall called an exit tax. See a whirling mass of tax tyranny raze to the
ground the nation's house of justice and hurl its constitution to the winds. See round the clock tax audits
and investigations conducted against successful people and the confiscation of their wealth enacted
under an Ultra Millionaire Tax Act. See state imposed wealth redistribution justified in the name of the
mystical oneness of all people. See the Rembrandts, the diamonds, the yachts and the stock portfolios
earned by successful people taken away from them in the name of social justice for the poor. See the
households of successful people taxed at rates of two percent, three percent, two hundred percent and
three hundred percent. See the earned gains, the lawful gains, the honest gains, the capital gains and
both the realized and unrealized gains produced by successful people disappear within the monstrous
jaws of a social welfare state. See successful people placed into captivity and cannibalized by a regime
which has repealed individual rights. See the class of successful people, who pay all the taxes and
support all of the nation, tarred, feathered, vilified and vituperated against by the emperors and their
mobs. See the government reject its constitutionally mandated mission to protect freedom and become
an organized crime regime in the service of communism. See millionaires, billionaires and producers
from all walks of life run for their lives before a national house on fire spreading a whirlwind of state
interposition  and  aggression.  See  the  rule  of  law replaced  by a  national  feeding  trough  filled  to
overflowing with expropriated wealth on which the swine of the Earth engorge themselves. See the
language of envy, covetousness, hatred and discontent rise in a miasma from the sewers, form a mass
base of support for tyranny, poison the political parties and process, raise a battle cry for universal tax
violence and human enslavement, and make America, the former arsenal of freedom, unfit and unsafe
for human habitation: ''The wealth tax is back. We have previously discussed the constitutional and
policy concerns surrounding the push by Democrats like Senator Elizabeth Warren (D-Massachusetts)
to introduce a wealth tax that would start with billionaires. It would not likely end there. The law would
also apply the same type of California approach to wealthy families fleeing the tax grab with a huge
'exit tax' so that there is no escaping from tax vortex. In addition, under the Ultra Millionaire Tax Act,
Warren  and  others  would  add  $100  to  increase  tax  audits  and  investigations.  The  captivity  tax
highlights the wealth redistribution mindset underlying Warren’s 'experiment'. Warren thrilled audience
for  years by  telling  the  rich  she  was  coming  after  'your  Rembrandts,  your  stock  portfolio,  your
diamonds and your yachts.' In one Democratic debate, she got applause by rubbing her hands together
after stating that she would take some of the wealth of fellow candidate John Delaney, a self made
millionaire worth $65 million. She has now made good on that threat.  The reintroduction of Ultra
Millionaire Tax Act would add a 2 percent tax on households worth $50 million to $1 billion and a 3
percent tax on households worth more than $1 billion. Warren is again repeating that talking point of
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President Joe Biden that billionaires pay less than the average citizen in taxes. That has been repeatedly
challenged. The claim is based on dubious accounting. A commonly cited White House study from
September, 2021 included unrealized capital gains in its analysis–something that neither wealthy nor
middle class citizens are taxed on. Warren and Biden want that to change but it is a false measure on
the current tax burden. It is also worth noting that 'the top 1 percent’s income share rose from 22.2
percent in 2020 to 26.3 percent in 2021 and its share of federal income taxes paid rose from 42.3
percent to 45.8 percent.' The top 50 percent of all taxpayers paid 97.7 percent federal income taxes. The
bottom 50 percent paid the only 2.3 percent. We previously discussed the push in California to impose
a retroactive tax on the many citizens and companies fleeing that state due to its high taxes and other
problems. Warren wants to do the same nationally. So if businesses are fleeing the country due to these
policies, they would have to essentially pay for the freedom in a type of captivity tax.  It is incredibly
short sighted. We need these businesses and we will not be able to coerce them into saying by trying to
make it  more expensive to leave.  Indeed, the captivity tax only magnifies the impression of a tax
system that is becoming an extension of the eat the rich rhetoric used by Warren and others. Politicians
have  long  turned  to  the  'Eat  the  rich!  battle  cry  when  things  are  not  working  out  politically  or
economically.  When  struggling  in  the  2020  Democratic  presidential  primaries,  Senator  Elizabeth
Warren (D-Mass) pledged a wealth tax, declaring that she was coming after 'the diamonds, the yachts
and the Rembrandts, too.' Then New York City Mayor Bill DeBlasio, another Democratic contender at
the time, was barely registering in the polls when he promised that 'we will tax the hell out of the
wealthy.' The Warren proposal would turn the eat the rich rhetoric to an all you can eat tax plan for the
government. There are major constitutional concerns raised by the plan to tax unrealized capital gains.
However, this is clearly playing well with much of the base of the party. The Wharton Budget Model at
the University of Pennsylvania did find that Warren’s legislation would raise $2.7 trillion in revenue
but it would also reduce capital by 31 percent, depress average hourly wages by 1.2 percent and reduce
gross domestic product (GDP) by 1.2 percent in 2050.'' (Eat The Rich: Warren Plan Would Impose
Wealth Tax, Captivity Tax And Allocate $100 Billion For Increasing Audit by Jonathan Turley). Look at
America  today and see  the  destruction  of  the  capitalist  system and the  rejection  of  the  American
Dream, the belief that a person can achieve and deserves to achieve success through hard work in a
society which values freedom. See people who are successful punished for their success and subjected
to a taxation rate of one hundred percent in the name of their paying their fair share in taxes. See the
hardworking sacrificed on the altar of the indolent, the intelligent sacrificed on the altar of the ignorant,
the ambitious sacrificed on the altar of the shiftless and the successful sacrificed on the altar of the
unsuccessful, in the name of achieving the highest human good of universal equality. See successful
people expropriated in order to finance government programs to support the lowest classes of society
and human bacteria multiplying in the cesspools of the Earth: "The hyper concentration of wealth
among a tiny number of multimillionaires and billionaires is a crisis for American capitalism and the
American Dream. Wealth inequality is at its highest level since the Gilded Age. The wealth share of the
richest 0.1 percent has nearly tripled since the late 1970s. It is time for the ultra millionaires to pay their
fair share so that critical government programs can be bolstered to help the everyday American. Our
proposal will make a meaningful difference in the lives of Americans who need the most help and
bolster our country's shrinking middle class." (Warren, Jayapal, Boyle Introduce Ultra Millionaire Tax
On Fortunes Over $50 Million, warren.senate.gov, quoting Representative Brendan Boyle). It was one
hundred and forty meters long and four meters high. The top of the wall was lined with smooth pipe,
making attempts to scale it difficult.  It was reinforced by mesh fencing, signal fencing, antivehicle
trenches, barbed wire, beds of nails and one hundred and sixteen watchtowers whose guards fired at
people seeking to escape by running through a sand bank called the Death Strip. This was the Berlin
Wall separating East Berlin from the West. For three decades symbolizing communism as nothing else
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did, it was an Iron Curtain of terror whose guards killed two hundred people seeking to escape into the
West. The fall of this nightmare known as the Wall of Shame saw the area around it strewn with debris
from broken concrete blocks. In the twenty first century the blocks were put together and reassembled
in America. There they formed a new Iron Curtain guarded by wealth taxes, confiscatory taxes, exit
taxes  and  captivity  taxes.  Constructed  by  the  communist  establishment  in  control  of  the  nation,
successful people and all people, rich or poor, who desire to live in freedom, have fled from it. Outside
its  confines,  civilized  people  throughout  the  world  have gazed at  it  in  horror  and pronounced the
immortal words: Ich bin ein Berliner. 

AMERICA'S FREEDOM OPPOSITION GUNNED DOWN

He has been the ruler of Russia since 1999. In power for a quarter of a century, he is the longest serving
Russian or Soviet leader since Joseph Stalin. Under his rule, the brief period of freedom in Russia came
to an end and the nation reverted to tyranny. Scoring zero on Transparency International's Corruption
Perceptions Index, The Economist's Democracy Index, Freedom House's Freedom In The World Index
and Reporters Without Borders' Press Freedom Index, Vladimir Putin's Russia can be encapsulated in a
single terrifying list. This is the list of political opponents killed on orders from Putin. The list is long
and provides a post mortem of the nation.  The cause of death of Russia today is  Vladimir Putin's
murderous dictatorship. Look at the list of Putin's opponents and see Death stalk the land and claim the
voices of freedom. Boris Nemtsov, shot dead on a bridge near the Kremlin, February 27, 2015. Sergei
Magnitsky,  killed by denial  of medical  care in a  Moscow prison on November 16,  2009.  Natalya
Estimirova, fatally shot in the head and chest in Ingushetia on July 16, 2009. Aleksandr Litvinenko,
fatally poisoned by radioactive polonium-210 in London on November 23, 2006. Anna Politkovskaya,
shot dead in her apartment building in Moscow on October 6, 2006. Sergei Yushkenov, shot dead in
front of his home in Moscow on April 17, 2003. Yvgeny Prigozhin, killed in a planned airplane crash in
the village of Kuzhenko on August 23, 2023. Copies of Putin's criminal playbook were made by Satan,
carried by his whirlwind out of the country, and placed into the world's former arsenal of freedom.
They have been set down in the highest offices of the land and decreed as secret government policy. In
a stark, brutal illustration of how far the moral cancer on the West has advanced, the cancer called
communism, voted into power in  a landslide in  the early twentieth century under a ticket marked
progressivism, the tactics of a dictator ruling the former world headquarters of communism have been
adopted  by the establishment  of  the  United States  of  America and employed to eliminate  the  last
remaining voices of freedom in the country. These voices are led by Donald Trump and they have been
subjected to a round the clock barrage of prosecutorial and judicial abuse the likes of which the nation
has never seen before, a level of abuse which has sounded the death knell of the rule of law in the
nation and inscribed on its tombstone the imagination defying words: Vladimir Putin's America. Look
at America today and see the prosecution of the opponents of communism and the prosecution of
nobody else. See criminal counts filed against the opponents of communism and against nobody else.
See the operation of a two tier system of justice which brings the opponents of communism  to its bar
and brings nobody else. See Special Counsel Robert Hur refuse to bring criminal charges against Joe
Biden  for  intentionally  removing  and  retaining  classified  government  documents,  for  transmitting
classified  information  to  unauthorized  individuals,  for  destroying  evidence  of  his  crimes,  and  for
attempting to obstruct the course of justice by attempting to coerce Hur to change his report inculpating
Biden. See Special Counsel Jack Smith prosecute Donald Trump on criminal charges from which Joe
Biden was excused. See New York State Attorney General Letitia James publicly state that her mission
in office is to prosecute, expropriate and jail Trump in any manner she can without regard to facts,
fairness or justice. See New York County Judge Arthur Engoron impose against Trump a fine of half a
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billion dollars for a victimless crime in which no act of force or fraud was committed, a fine which
violates  the  Constitution's  Eighth  Amendment  ban  on  excessive  fines  and  cruel  and  unusual
punishment. See Manhattan District Attorney Alvin Bragg prosecute Trump for a federal offense the
federal  Department  of  Justice had rejected.  See the Justice Department  refuse to interview Hunter
Biden, search his property or prosecute him for felonies, and see the department give him immunity
from jail, because his father is the leader of the establishment. See the Justice Department refuse to
prosecute communist terror groups such as Antifa and see it help them sharpen their axes to commit
further acts of terror. See the Justice Department refuse to prosecute proDemocrat lawyers such as
Rachael  Rollins  and  proDemocrat  FBI  Director  James  Comey  for  leaking  classified  government
documents  to  the  press.  See  the  Justice  Department  prosecute  Donald  Trump's  National  Security
Advisor Michael Flynn for making false statements, but prosecuted simply because he was Trump's
national security advisor. See a legal system biased, dishonest, reek with double standards and selective
prosecutions, weaponized to pursue figures unpopular with the establishment, and fashioned into a tool
of totalitarian enslavement in a nation descended into the abyss: ''For many citizens, mendacity,  or
dishonesty, is wafting from various courtrooms around the country. The odor is becoming intolerable
for many Americans as selective prosecution is being raised in a wide array of cases. The problem is
that  courts  have  made  it  virtually  impossible  to  use  this  claim to  dismiss  counts.  Yet  there  is  a
disturbing level of merit to some of these underlying objections. For years, conservatives have objected
that there is a two tier system of justice in this country. I have long resisted such claims, but it has
become increasingly difficult to deny the obvious selective prosecution in a variety of recent cases and
opinions. I have long stated that the charges against Trump over documents at Mar a Lago are strong
and based on established precedent. However, the recent decision of Special Counsel Robert Hur not to
bring criminal charges against President Joe Biden has undermined even that case. Hur described four
decades of Biden serially violating laws governing classified documents. The evidence included Biden
telling a third party that he had classified material in his house and actually reading from a classified
document to his noncleared ghostwriter. There is evidence of an effort to destroy evidence and later an
effort of the White House to change the report. There is also Biden’s repeated denial of any knowledge
or memory of the documents found in nine locations where he worked or lived. Hur ultimately had to
justify the lack of charges based on a belief that he could not secure a conviction from a DC jury with
an elderly defendant with diminished mental faculties. Although Special Counsel Jack Smith could still
proceed on obstruction counts, his prosecution of Trump for the retention and mishandling of national
security documents is absurdly in conflict with the treatment Biden is receiving. In New York, the
legislature changed the statute of limitations to allow Trump to be sued while New York Attorney
General Letitia James effectively ran on a pledge of selectively prosecuting him. She never specified
any particular crime, just promising to bag Trump. Ultimately, James used a law in an unprecedented
way to secure an absurd penalty of roughly half a billion dollars, even though no one lost a dime
because  of  the  Trump loans.  Manhattan  District  Attorney Alvin  Bragg  has  also  come up with  an
unprecedented way of using a state law to effectively prosecute Trump for a federal offense that the
Justice Department has already rejected. The same odor has been lingering in the Hunter Biden cases.
The Justice Department had reached a ridiculous plea agreement with Hunter Biden that would have
allowed for no jail time and a sweeping immunity agreement that would have protected him from all of
his other alleged crimes. As the plea agreement fell apart in court, the prosecutor admitted that he had
never seen a defendant given such a deal over his long career. This came after the Justice Department
had allowed the statute of limitations to run out  on major felonies and scuttled efforts  to  conduct
searches and interviews. Even after that embarrassing hearing, the Justice Department was still trying
to preserve the agreement. It is not just the Trump and Biden cases where there is a stench of selective
prosecution.  Consider  a  few other  recent  cases.  In  California,  US District  Court  Judge Cormac J.
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Carney  issued  an opinion that  found  such  evidence  of  selective  prosecution  against  conservative
groups. In considering a far right group, Carney noted that the Justice Department has had sharply
different approaches based on the political views of the defendants. Antifa and other leftist groups often
see  charges  dropped,  whereas  federal  prosecutors  seek  draconian  sentences  against  conservative
defendants. 'Such selective prosecution leaves the troubling impression that the government believes
speech on the left more deserving of protection than speech on the right. The government remains free
to prosecute those, like Defendants, who allegedly use violence to suppress First Amendment rights.
But  it  cannot  ignore  others,  equally  culpable,  because  Defendants’ speech  and  beliefs  are  more
offensive.  The  Constitution  forbids  such  selective  prosecution,'  Carney noted.  That  treatment  was
equally glaring when federal prosecutors convicted an Antifa supporter who took an ax to the door of
Senator John Hoeven’s office in Fargo. He was given no jail time, and the FBI even returned his ax. ''
(The Odor Of Mendacity: 2024 Could Turn On Smell Of Selective Prosecution From Georgia To New
York by Jonathan Turley).  ''A great  deal  of  the  background to  this  story is  accurate.  SMERSH, a
contraction of Smiert Spionam—Death to Spies—exists and remains today the most secret department
of the Soviet government.'' (Author's Note by Ian Fleming). The story is From Russia, With Love, the
fifth novel by Ian Fleming featuring British Secret Service agent James Bond. The story is about a plot
by SMERSH to  assassinate  Bond and discredit  his  organization.  Described in  terrifying  detail  by
Fleming, the killing of the opposition migrated from the Soviet Union to Vladimir Putin's Russia and
landed in America in the twenty first century. 

BRITAIN'S REDS SHUT DOWN MUSEUM

In 1816, Richard FitzWilliam, an Anglo-Irish nobleman in the Peerage of Ireland, founded a museum.
Located in the city of Cambridge, it housed one of the finest collections of antiquities and modern art in
the world. It housed over a half a million objects which illustrated world history and art from ancient
times to the present. It housed works by Monet, Picasso, Rubens, van Gogh, Rembrandt, Cezanne, Van
Dyck, Canaletto, and featured relief sculptures from the ancient cities of Persepolis and Nimrud. For
two centuries, this flagship member of the University of Cambridge Museums enthralled visitors with
its spectacular collections comprising masterpiece paintings and renowned historical artefacts. In the
twenty first century, a tidal wave swept into the FitzWilliam Museum, smashed its collections and shut
it down. This was no natural disaster but a man made event. It was a tidal wave which had swept into
traditions and institutions across the West and scattered them like broken glass. It was a tidal wave
voted into power in a landslide in the twentieth century under the guise of progressivism, but signifying
the forces of civilizational collapse, it was anything but progressive. It was a movement of regression,
moral, social and political regression, and rejecting the traditions and institutions bequeathed by the
Enlightenment,  it  sought  to  take  mankind  back  the  nameless  eons  of  tribal  history  and  caveman
violence. This movement was founded in the nineteenth century by Karl Marx but burgeoned into a
significant cultural force in the twentieth century. Capturing the hearts and minds of the masses, this
movement of Marxism mutated into a triple headed monster in the middle of the twentieth century and
commenced a rampage as a fire breathing nightmare known as Gender, Race and Class Politics. In the
twenty first century, its generation of intense heat caused the flow of powerful convection currents
through the air, which in turn led to strong winds and storms and generated tidal waves. These tidal
waves swept into the FitzWilliam Museum and claimed one more victim, captured one more cultural
asset, in their fearsome mission of civilizational destruction. In the twenty first century, the FitzWilliam
Museum was shut down, not to effect repairs, but to do damage to the West, and make one more move
to  render  the  West  decayed,  ragged,  skeletal  and  unrecognizable  in  its  grave.  Look  inside  the
FitzWilliam Museum and see a building whose electricity has been cut off, whose lights have been
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disabled and whose collections have been broken into pieces. See the museum proclaim that works by
the Western masters are products of white racism and their exhibition makes blacks feel unsafe and
disrespected. A progressive museum selects works of art on the basis of the gender, race, class and
politics of the artist, and practices its discrimination in the name of diversity, equity and inclusion. A
progressive museum is a Marxist museum governed by policies, procedures, strategies and action plans
for world revolution. A progressive museum educates, trains and indoctrinates its staff in the principles
of gender, race and class politics. A progressive museum features an organizational culture modeled
after the communist party in which the director serves as general secretary enforcing the people's party
line of tribal justice.  A progressive museum features exhibitions, displays, collections, acquisitions,
collaborations,  courses,  projects,  partnerships,  stakeholders,  staff,  visitors,  communications  and
research programs which aim at one thing and one thing alone. Rejecting the traditional canons of art,
beauty and Enlightenment culture, they aim at the reduction of civilization to a malarial,  mosquito
infested marshland presided over by cohorts of radical women, nonwhites, indigenous groups and the
poor: ''At the Fitzwilliam Museum, we pledge to champion equity, diversity, inclusion, antiracism and
accessibility: 1. We are committed to fostering an environment that welcomes visitors and staff from all
backgrounds, values lived experience, and where everyone feels safe and respected. 2. We will actively
promote dialogue, research and exchange that stimulates diverse perspectives and participation, and
that  is  accessible  for  all.  3.  We  will  proactively  identify  and  address  inequalities,  challenge
discriminatory  practice  and  embed  principles  of  antiracism,  wherever  they  appear  across  our
organization, underpinning this effort with robust policies, procedures, strategies and action plans. 4.
We will ensure staff at all levels of the organization have access to meaningful and ongoing education,
training and learning to positively influence our practice,  to continuously shape our organizational
culture, and to strengthen our EDI commitments, so that together we can identify and address systemic
barriers.  5.  We seek  to  be  actively  antiracist  in  action--not  just  in  words.  6.  We  pledge  that  our
exhibitions and displays, collections and new acquisitions, collaborations, policies, learning initiatives,
projects and research programs, partnerships, stakeholder engagement, and communications will reflect
and promote equity, diversity, inclusivity, antiracist practice and ensure access for all. 7. We pledge to
evolve and improve as an organization, in our EDI policies, strategies and practice, by ensuring our
visitors,  staff,  volunteers,  communities,  partners  and  Syndicate  members  can  all  help  shape  our
principles of equity, diversity, and inclusion.''  (FitzWilliam Museum, website,  Equity, Diversity and
Inclusion). Look inside the FitzWilliam Museum and see the reduction of a hallowed institution for the
exhibition  of  art  and  culture  into  a  fiery  pulpit  blasting  out  political  indoctrination  and  the
regimentation of thought. See the promotion of black identity. See the promotion of gender identity.
See the promotion of  gay and lesbian identity.  See the promotion of  transgender  identity.  See the
promotion of radicalism, wokism and the overthrow of liberal democracy. See museum visitors treated
like wayward children in need of adult  education in the principles of a virulent antiEnlightenment
ideology. See the condemnation of capitalism as a system of slavery and empire subjugating women,
nonwhites and the poor. See buckets of black ink, marked political correctness, thrown at a two century
old, world renowned art collection and thrown into the faces of the public. See every wall,  panel,
gallery and display case shouting out a theme as repetitive as it is violent. Rejecting the values of
reason and individual rights civilized people have fought to defend for thousands of years, this is the
theme of hatred, fanaticism, dictatorship and destruction in the service of tribal identity, depicted in
artworks  with  Marxist  content:  ''In  a  room called  identity,  eighteenth  century portraits  by William
Hogarth of a wealthy merchant family are going back on display. But now they will share space at the
Fitzwilliam Museum in Cambridge with a subversive contemporary portrait by black British artist Joy
Labinjo, that imagines eighteenth century African abolitionist Olaudah Equiano and his mixed race
family. In another room, labeled interiors, Ethel Walker’s 1916 painting Silence of the Ravine–thought
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to be the earliest female nude painted by an openly lesbian artist in the UK–is waiting to be exhibited
for the first time. Nearby, a wall of paintings dating from the 1720s to the 1920s all depict the same
activity, once thought to be scandalous and unnatural: women reading. When the university museum
reopens its main painting galleries on March 15 after a major five year refurbishment, its director, Luke
Syson, is  hoping that his  radical  shake up of the way its  world renowned permanent collection is
displayed will  attract masses of visitors–but not masses of controversy.  'I  would love to think that
there’s  a  way of  telling  these  larger,  more  inclusive  histories  that  doesn’t  feel  as  if  it  requires  a
pushback from those who try to suggest that any interest at all in work by women artists or artists of
color–or subject matter that takes us into the world of LBGT culture–is being radical chic or what
would now be called woke,' said Syson. 'Being inclusive and representative shouldn’t be controversial;
it should be enriching. We should all welcome the opportunities to understand each other better through
the eyes of great makers and artists.' Recent big rehangs of permanent collections, for example by the
Tate and the National Portrait Gallery, were denounced by art critics as 'preachy' and 'fundamentally
dull'  attempts to tell  people what to think,  imposing 'current concerns with slavery,  empire,  sexual
identity and gender' on to famous art in a 'glib', 'patronizing' and 'belittling' way. In the FitzWilliam’s
new display, which Syson said 'suggests some new ways of looking, without insisting on them' the
museum’s much loved, iconic works hang close to important 'new discoveries' from its 208 year old
collection, by lesser known painters, and major new acquisitions by eminent contemporary artists such
as  Labinjo,  Barbara  Walker  and  Jake  Grewal.  Gone  are  the  somewhat  esoteric  rooms  filled  with
chronological  displays  of British and French masterpieces  from the 18th,  19th and 20th centuries.
Instead, each room has a simple theme, explained on an introductory panel. Paintings dating back to the
1600s from across Europe hang in the same room as contemporary works, to bring them into 'thought
provoking  dialogues'  with  each  other,  said  the  curator  of  the  new  rehang,  Dr  Rebecca  Birrell.''
(‘Inclusivity Shouldn’t Be Controversial’: Will A Radical Art Rehang Give Cambridge An Unwanted
Woke Row? by Donna Ferguson). Time: 1966 to 1976. Place: China. A propaganda poster looms across
the  sky,  its  caption  reading:  The Chinese  People's  Liberation  Army Is  The Great  School  Of  Mao
Zedong  Thought.  This  was  the  time  of  the  Cultural  Revolution,  a  movement  of  mass  cultural
destruction in the service of Marxism, a movement of destruction without precedent in the history of
mankind. Perpetrated by Mao Zedong's Red Guards, this ten year night of broken glass came to end
when Mao died. In twenty first century Britain, in the nation which brought freedom as a system to the
West, the Red Guards have reconstituted themselves and are back in business. Smashing the classics of
Western art as manifestations of oppression, the oppressive structures of reason, science, capitalism,
colonialism, patriarchy and white supremacy, they have taken over the FitzWilliam Museum.

AN ANTIUNIVERSE CALLED AMERICA

In Greek mythology, Tartarus is a deep abyss and dungeon of horror. It is the place where souls are
judged after death and the evil receive eternal punishment. A bronze anvil dropped from the heavens
would fall nine days before it reached the Earth, and would fall another nine days before it reached
Tartarus. The famous myth collector Apollodorus describes Tartarus: ''It is a gloomy place in Hades as
far distant from the Earth as the Earth is distant from the sky.''  (Bibliotheca by Apollodorus). This
negative universe in which everything good is held to be evil and everything evil is held to be good has
come alive in a land in which the naive and untutored had least expected it to come alive. They had
least expected it because they could not imagine that a land once venerated as the world's arsenal of
virtue and freedom could ever  descend into an arsenal  of evil  and tyranny.  They have since been
educated that  the cancer  of cultural  degeneration spares  no nation high or  low and is  a merciless
pursuer of the weak and the mighty. They have since been educated that no nation is immune from this
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cancer unless it is prepared to fight it tooth and nail and to die in defense of civilization. They have
since been educated that a nation grown weary and exhausted is a nation deceased in all but name,
whether the name of this nation be Zimbabwe or the United States of America, and is a failed nation
existing as a zombie in a land of the living dead. In the twenty first century, the fall of the mightiest of
nations has occurred, and the United States of America has descended into a dungeon of horror which
worships at the altar of evil and tyranny. This fall was a century in the making and commenced in the
early years of the twentieth century when the people rejected the traditions and institutions bequeathed
to them by the Enlightenment via their Founding Fathers, and embraced religions of various stripes and
varieties. The rejection of reason and the embrace of religion is the hallmark of  civilizations in a state
of degeneration; it struck ancient Rome fifteen hundred years ago and placed the manifestations of
irrationality present at that time, Christianity, barbarism, and the emperors and their mobs, upon the
throne of power; and in the twenty first century, in the nation once viewed as the successor to Rome in
its defense of freedom, it has struck, and rendered that nation morally and spiritually unrecognizable.
Look at America in the present day and see a nation turned upside down and placed into a state in
which good becomes evil and evil becomes good, a state brought about by the embrace of religion, a
state which has brought Tartarus back to life. Look at America today and see two religions, Marxism
and Christianity,  turn morality on its  head, vie for power and fight over the dead body of reason.
Elections Neither Free Nor Fair. The American people's embrace of Marxism resulted in the theft of
2020 presidential election and the installation of the Marxist candidate, Joe Biden, as president of the
United States. The election was stolen by millions of votes manufactured for Joe Biden through ballot
harvesting, drop boxes, extended early voting, extended late voting, the refusal to create paper ballots
to  audit  electronic  ballots,  the  refusal  to  establish  voter  identification  requirements,  and  voting
machines programmed to count votes for Joe Biden and count votes for nobody else. The election was
stolen by the refusal of courts, including the United States Supreme Court, to examine evidence of
electoral fraud or unconstitutional state actions, and their decision to dismiss cases on spurious grounds
unrelated  to  merit.  The  United  States  Supreme  Court  dismissed  a  suit  brought  by  Texas  against
Pennsylvania, Georgia, Michigan and Wisconsin exposing unconstitutional executive actions in these
states, actions which usurped legislative authority mandated by the Constitution. The Court dismissed
the suit on the grounds that Texas has no standing, no right to sue, no legal interest in how other states
conduct their elections. Legal scholars and ordinary people alike were left aghast and reeled back in
horror at this ruling because they knew that when any one state violates the Constitution, every state
has standing to sue in the name of the public interest and the preservation of the rule of law. They knew
that Texas has standing to sue to enforce the Constitution because no state should be allowed, for any
reason and under any circumstances, to violate the Constitution with impunity, lest the entire nation
descend into a lawless jungle. They knew that when one state violates the Constitution, it becomes an
East Germany behind an Iron Curtain, and the rest of the nation becomes a West Germany, which
beholds it under the famous words, as tragic as they are immortal,  Ich bein ein Berliner: ''Democrats
and mainstream media like to claim that about sixty judges found no election fraud or irregularities in
the 2020 election. The truth is that the vast majority of those judges, including the US Supreme Court,
 did not investigate the merits of those cases. Instead, they found legal technical reasons like 'lack of
standing' to dismiss them without any investigations into actual election fraud.'' (Will Dems Take Over
The House This Year To Stop Trump? By Michael Master).  The Persecution Of Freedom Fighters.
The American people's embrace of Marxism has seen the weaponization of the law to a level never
before seen in the nation, a level which has evicted the nation from the Western community of nations
and sent it crashing into the front ranks of lawless regimes such as Russia, China, Iran and Venezuela.
It has seen Marxist jurisdictions across the nation manufacture crimes against the national leader of the
freedom opposition, Donald Trump, in an attempt to jail him for life. It has seen the refusal of these
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jurisdictions to prosecute Joe Biden for running a global influence peddling operation while he was
vice president, an operation attested by Biden's former business associates: ''During Chairman Comer’s
questioning, Biden family business associates Tony Bobulinski and Jason Galanis confirmed Joe Biden
was involved in his  family’s influence peddling schemes. Representative Comer: During the 118th
Congress, this Committee has investigated Joe Biden’s involvement in his family’s influence peddling
schemes around the world. Mr. Bobulinski, was Joe Biden involved with any of your business dealings
with Hunter Biden and James Biden? Mr Bobulinski: Yes he was. Representative Comer: Mr Galanis,
are you aware of any times Hunter Biden used Joe Biden, with Joe Biden’s knowledge, to benefit their
business? Mr. Galanis: Yes.''  (Hearing Wrap Up: Witnesses Expose Joe Biden’s Involvement in His
Family’s Corrupt Influence Peddling Schemes, March 20, 2024, House Oversight Committee, website).
The weaponization of the law has seen the the jailing of thousands of people who attempted to stage an
insurrection at the United States Capital Building on January 6, 2021. The people made the attempt in
order to stop the certification of a fraudulent and unconstitutional election after they were unable to
obtain peaceful redress of grievances. They made the attempt justified by a principle known to civilized
people for thousands of years. This is the principle that when peaceful means to correct injustice and
remove tyranny have failed, it is the right and the duty of the victims to overthrow the regime by force
of arms. This principle guided the attempted insurrections staged across Eastern Europe against the
Marxist regimes in power during the Cold War; it guided the Warsaw Ghetto Uprising in Poland in
1943,  staged  to  stop  the  transport  of  the  population  into  the  gas  chambers  of  the  Majdanek  and
Treblinka extermination camps; and it guided the American insurrectionists on January 6, whose cause
of constititional government and free and fair elections had been rebuffed by the courts:  ''Democrats
accuse Republicans of being lawless, a claim epitomized by their massively lawless campaign against
the GOP’s current leader, President Donald J. Trump, who in a short period of time has been accused of
over 100 different crimes in left wing jurisdictions nationwide–all in an effort to block his reelection
and make sure he dies in prison. Yet despite the prevailing Opposite Land narrative, Democrats have
proven to be the lawless party, abusing America’s best in the world legal system in its wild persecution
of  Trump.  The  truth  of  this  assessment  was  affirmed  recently  by  the  Supreme  Court’s
humiliating unanimous decision  annihilating  one  of  the  Democrats’ lawfare  cases  against  Trump.
Ironically, while Democrats claim the 45th president is a big time criminal, in reality it is Joe Biden,
America’s 46th president, who heads up an actual crime family involving at least nine family members,
as  House  Oversight  Committee  Chairman  James  Comer  has  revealed.  Far  worse  than  Democrats’
persecution of Donald Trump and simultaneous defense of an epically corrupt man like Joe Biden is
their mass criminal prosecutions and imprisonment of hundreds of innocent, patriotic Americans for
simply protesting the theft of the 2020 election. In so doing, the Biden administration has embraced the
kind of unthinkable political weaponization of the legal system that previously was associated with the
most  brutal  and  corrupt  Third  World  dictators.  Ultimately,  the  hundreds  of  unjust  January  6
prosecutions, convictions and lengthy incarcerations are simply part of Democrats’ appalling campaign
to brand not just Trump, but his supporters, as terrorists and insurrectionists attempting to overthrow
America’s  constitutional  system of  government.''  (America  Has  Morphed  Into  OPPOSITE LAND,
World Net Daily, March 19, 2024).  The Outlawing Of Abortion. The degeneration of America has
seen the rise of a revitalized Christian movement. This movement has installed six judges on the United
States Supreme and convened a Conference of Catholic Bishops within their chambers. Obeying orders
handed down from the Congregation for the Doctrine of the Faith, these judges issued a landmark
ruling on June 24, 2022. In the case Dobbs vs Jackson Women's Health Organizarion, the Court ruled
that the First Amendment to the Constiution, which constructs a wall of separation between church and
state and prohibits the state establishment of religion, does not exist. The Court ruled that the states
have a right to declare that at the moment of human conception, at the moment of union between a
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sperm and an ovum, at the moment of creation of one cell zygote, a mystical, supernatural soul appears
which is equal to an actual human person possessing forty trillion cells, and the destruction of this
zygote is an act of murder. The Court ruled that the states have a right to declare that ordinary people
cannot see this supernatural soul appearing at the moment of conception by virtue of the fact that they
possess a properly functioning visual system, and are blind because they have eyes.  Postmortem. In
photography, a negative is an image of total inversion, in which light areas appear dark and dark areas
appear light. A negative color image is in addition color reversed, in which red areas appear cyan, green
areas appear magenta, and blue areas appear yellow. In the twenty first century, cultural pathologists
have conducted a postmortem on America. As part of their examination, they have taken a photograph
of the deceased nation. The print reveals a terrifying state of total moral inversion and the worship of
darkness. 

ISLAMIST RED GUARDS ATTACK AMSTERDAM

It is known as the Venice of the North for its culture and canals and is a UNESCO World Heritage
sight. During the Dutch Golden Age of the seventeenth century, it was a leading port, an economic
powerhouse,  and a world center for finance,  trade and the arts.  But it  was more than this.  It  was
venerated throughout the world as a paragon of liberalism, tolerance and the protection of free speech.
This city is Amsterdam and for centuries it had enjoyed special honor and occupied the front ranks of
alpha  cities  of  the  West.  In  the  twenty  first  century,  this  capital  and  most  populous  city  in  the
Netherlands has been razed to the ground by a mighty storm. It has been flattened and shattered beyond
recognition and its debris lie in the graveyard of failed cities and nations. The storm which flooded and
destroyed Amsterdam, against which its famous, founding dams were of no avail, is the storm which
has submerged the West. This storm was set into motion in the early years of the twentieth century by
the people in Europe and America who abandoned reason and freedom, which for centuries had shined
for the oppressed from a beacon marked the Enlightenment, and voted in a landslide to place religion
into power under a ticket marked progressivism. The diametrical opposite of true progressivism, this
religion was a movement of social, moral, spiritual and political regression into the Stone Age of tribal
savagery. This movement is known as Marxism and the tribe its original version exalted, peddled by its
nineteenth century founder Karl Marx, was class, and in particular the class it called the proletariat. The
first Marxist storm of class war would be joined in the mid twentieth century by the neoMarxist storms
of gender war and race war, and these three storms together combined to destroy liberal traditions and
institutions in the twenty first century, and raise the battle cry for a holocaust against their targeted
enemies:  the  demographic  of  successful  white  males.  This  triple  headed,  fire  breathing,  Marxist
monster called Gender, Race and Class Politics is a bloodthirsty storm on a rampage fueled by popular
hatred and discontent, a storm whose violent behavior has taken down Amsterdam and taken down the
West, and dug a mass grave whose tombstone reads: Death by moral exhaustion and collapse. Blinded
by white  hot  hatred  of  freedom,  the  Gender,  Race  and  Class  monster  has  reached  out  and  made
common cause with an enemy of freedom originating outside the West, whose rampage commenced in
the desert wastelands of the East. This second monster is known as Islam. Working in concert, these
nightmare  creatures  from  the  West  and  from  the  East  have  attacked  Amsterdam.  The  Marxist
establishment in control of the Netherlands has let Islam through the gates of this hallowed city, and
weaponized the nation's legal system to persecute the vanishing minority within which opposes the
reigning popular  tyrannies  whose flags are  painted with the Hammer and Sickle and the Star  and
Crescent. Look at what these enemies of reason and freedom have done to the city in which the stock
exchange was born in 1602, and see the city's transformation into a savage jungle watched over by the
Red Guards of political  correctness.  See its  transformation into a mosque of Marxism and a party
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congress of Islam in which the stock exchange, the science exchange, the reason exchange and the
freedom exchange lie buried forever. Look at Amsterdam today and see a city criminalize criticism of
Islam and fill up prisons with the critics. See a city march in favor of Islam and march against freedom
of speech. See a city fuel a rampage of jihadist murders. See a city imprison freedom of thought behind
a  barbed  wire  fence  marked  Islamist devoutness,  sensitivity and  political  correctness.  See  a  city
descend into a wild mob demanding the return of Hitler's death squads and the launching of a second
holocaust, now under the battle cry,  Viva, viva Intifada!: ''Until the other day I’d never heard of the
Dutch  comedian  Hans  Teeuwen,  but  I  became  an  instant  fan  after  reading,  in  a
2016 Guardian profile that  I  dug  up  online,  that  after  the  2004  jihadist  murder  of  filmmaker  and
raconteur Theo van Gogh (who, it appeared, had been a friend of his) Teeuwen took a break from
comedy to become, in the words of Guardian reporter Brian Logan, 'a vocal campaigner for freedom of
speech–and against Islam, which he sees as opposed to it.' Logan quoted Teeuwen as calling Islam 'the
most dangerous subject there is, the biggest taboo. And, I’m afraid, the biggest enemy of free speech.'
Logan noted that after the prosecution, earlier that year, of the German comic Jan Bohmermann for
mocking Recep Tayyip Erdogan (at the time, German law criminalized insults directed at foreign heads
of state), Teeuwen, out of solidarity with Bohmermann, told a Dutch TV interviewer that he’d been a
customer of Erdogan back when the Turkish president was a boy prostitute in an Istanbul bordello.
Simply by telling this joke, Teeuwen was risking arrest in his own country. He didn’t give a damn. It
was  striking  to  see  a  writer  for  the Guardian, that  most  PC of  British  newspapers, applauding the
'antiPC'  Teeuwen  for  'star[ing]  down  piety,  sensitivity  and  your  expectations  of  comedy  with  a
ferocious glare. You end up just marvelling at his control, his shamelessness, and at the different ways
he has of making us laugh.'  Logan compared Teeuwen to one of my own favorite standups, Doug
Stanhope, noting that Teeuwen, like Stanhope, 'often says objectionable things,' but better 'a comic who
makes me puzzle, interrogate my own opinions, laugh with astonishment and feel the ground slip from
under my feet, than one with whom I always agree.' Two years later, when Teeuwen performed in Oslo,
the headline of a news story in Dagbladet zeroed in on Teeuwen’s readiness to challenge 'the biggest
taboo':  'Islam–Critical  Comic  Visits  Norway.'  Teeuwen, wrote  Dagbladet’s Knut-Eirik  Lindblad,  'is
demonstrably fearless.' Teeuwen proved this yet again the other day. On March 12, he posted a video
on Instagram in which he wore a  black wig,  held a white  flower,  and imitated Amsterdam mayor
Femke Halsemas, who, two days earlier, speaking at the opening of the national Holocaust Museum,
had defended the free speech rights of an unruly mob who’d marred the event by waving Palestine
flags and chanting 'Viva, viva Intifada!' '' (Policing Speech In Amsterdam by Bruce Bawer). Look at
Amsterdam today and see a city submerged in a tidal wave of proPalestinian protestors. See a city
proclaim itself antiIsrael and declare war on the Jewish state. See a city smash synagogues, tear up
Jewish neighborhoods and advocate the extermination of Jews. See a city proclaim that Israel is a
genocidal state because it is a capitalist state and must be put on trial for war crimes. See a city arm
Islamist activists to attack the police and burn their automobiles. See a city reject its noble heritage and
march  with  the  Prince  of  Darkness  whose  banners  read  terror,  assassination,  national  socialism,
communism, Hamas and the overthrow of liberal democracy: ''Thousands of proPalestinian protesters
converged on Amsterdam on Sunday as the Dutch city unveiled the National Holocaust Museum in a
ceremony attended by Willem-Alexander of the Netherlands and Israeli President Isaac Herzog. Riot
police were forced to be deployed to hold back over 2,000 antiIsrael protesters as they attempted to
march on the Portuguese Synagogue in Amsterdam during the opening of the new National Holocaust
Museum.  Demonstrators  were  seen  waving  Palestinian  flags,  carrying  signs  accusing  Israel  of
'genocide' in Gaza, and calling for Israeli President Herzog to be tried at the International Criminal
Court (ICC) for war crimes, Dutch public broadcaster NOS reported. Clashes with the police were also
witnessed, while some activists were seen climbing on top of police vehicles. According to the  De
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Telegraaf newspaper, the activists also took to shooting fireworks and throwing eggs at the police. They
also  were  seen  plastering  stickers  on  police  vans  with  the  face  of  Herzog with  the  text  'wanted'.
King Willem-Alexander, who gave a speech at the opening ceremony held at the synagogue, was booed
as he officially opened the museum’s building. For his part, President Herzog used the occasion to once
again call upon Hamas in Gaza to release the hostages taken from Israel during the October 7th terror
attacks by the jihadist  Palestinian group.  'Let’s  pray in  this  house of prayer  for  the release of the
hostages,' Herzog said. During his speech, the Israeli president invoked World War II, saying that too
many people in the Netherlands stood by as Jews were being gathered up to be exterminated. However,
Herzog also praised the courage of the people who resisted the nazis, recounting an instance of two
Dutch citizens who risked their lives by hiding Jews. Herzog said that after the war, the Jews housed by
the Dutch later moved to Israel and that their grandson died fighting to protect the Jewish state. The
Israeli president’s presence at the unveiling of the museum drew the ire of local activists, who accused
him of war crimes over his country’s military response to the October 7th terror attacks, in which
Hamas  terrorists  slaughtered  around  1,200  people  in  Israel  and  took  hundreds  more  captive.''
(ProPalestinian Protesters Swarm Holocaust Museum Opening in Amsterdam by Kurt Zindulka). She
was fifteen years old. At this age, boys and girls begin thinking about their future, their careers, their
partners and their families. They begin planning for a life of purpose and achievement. Not this girl.
Deprived of a childhood and deprived of a future, she is sitting in a concentration camp waiting to die.
In March 1945, she died at Bergen Belsen. She and her family had been deported by the Gestapo from
Amsterdam in August 1944. Her name was Anne Frank and the killers of this Jewish girl, whose diary
broke the world's heart, have returned to Amsterdam and are back in business. Their rifles fire round
the clock. This time around, the names of the rounds have changed. They are marked  Marxism and
Islam and they define Amsterdam today. 

THE MEANING OF DUE PROCESS

This case is decided upon an economic theory which a large part of the country does not entertain. If it
were a question whether I agreed with that theory, I should desire to study it further and long before
making up my mind. But I do not conceive that to be my duty, because I strongly believe that my
agreement or disagreement has nothing to do with the right of a majority to embody their opinions in
law. It is settled by various decisions of this court that state constitutions and state laws may regulate
life in many ways which we, as legislators, might think as injudicious, or, if you like, as tyrannical, as
this, and which, equally with this, interfere with the liberty to contract. Sunday laws and usury laws are
ancient examples. A more modern one is the prohibition of lotteries. The liberty of the citizen to do as
he likes so long as he does not interfere with the liberty of others to do the same, which has been a
shibboleth for some well-known writers, is interfered with by school laws, by the Post Office, by every
state or municipal institution which takes his money for purposes thought desirable, whether he likes it
or not. The 14th Amendment does not enact Mr Herbert Spencer’s Social Statics.  Thus spoke Oliver
Wendell Holmes in his dissenting opinion in the case  Lochner vs New York (1905). In the history of
Western jurisprudence, no greater falsehood has ever be uttered and no greater denial of the rule of law
or the meaning of due process has ever been advanced. The Fourteenth Amendment to the United
States Constitution which Justice Holmes references states as follows: ''All persons born or naturalized
in the United States, and subject to the jurisdiction thereof, are citizens of the United States and of the
State wherein they reside. No State shall make or enforce any law which shall abridge the privileges or
immunities of citizens of the United States; nor shall any State deprive any person of life, liberty, or
property, without due process of law; nor deny to any person within its jurisdiction the equal protection
of the laws.'' Due process of law. A fundamental legal principle proclaimed on the pages of  Magna
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Carta and championed for centuries by liberal jurisprudence. Over the past one hundred years, it has
been  reinterpreted  by  totalitarians  to  refer  to  the  principle  of  procedural  correctness,  and  has  in
consequence been deployed to sanction all manner of state interference in the rights of the individual.
The principle of procedural correctness and the principle of due process of law are as opposed to each
other  as  night  is  opposed to  day and  slavery is  opposed to  freedom.  The  principle  of  procedural
correctness states that a law is valid merely if it has been duly enacted by a legislature following the
correct procedures. A court evaluating the law from the standpoint of procedural correctness merely
evaluates whether the legislature had the authority to pass the law and whether it followed the correct
procedures in doing do. By contrast,  the principle of due process goes beyond mere procedure and
states that a law is valid only if it is fair and just, and though a law may meet procedural requirements
in its passage, it is invalid if it is unfair and unjust. The notion of due process of law, as opposed to
mere process of law, refers to a process of law which is due, which is due to a person, which is due to a
person who, as a person, is born free. The history of this notion is as old as English freedom and for
centuries made England the freest nation on Earth, and for a century, before it was rejected in America,
made America the freest nation on Earth. Listen to clause 39 of the Magna Carta, issued in 1215 by
King  John  of  England:  ''No  free  man  shall  be  seized  or  imprisoned,  or  stripped  of  his  rights  or
possessions, or outlawed or exiled, or deprived of his standing in any other way, nor will we proceed
with force against him, or send others to do so, except by the lawful judgment of his equals or by the
law of the land." The phrase by the law of the land means by the principles of fairness and justice or it
means nothing whatever. Absent the requirement to respect fairness and justice, it would mean that the
state could deprive the individual of all his rights. Listen to the statutory version of this clause, passed
in 1354 during the reign of Edward III of England: ''No man of what state or condition he be, shall be
put out of his lands or tenements nor taken, nor disinherited, nor put to death, without he be brought to
answer by due process of law." By the process of law  due to him as a free born person. Listen to
Edward Coke, Chief Justice of the Court of Common Pleas in England, who in 1608 wrote in Institutes
Of Law In England: ''No man shall be deprived [of his rights] but by the law of the land, that is, by the
common law, statute law or custom of England, that is, to speak it once and for all, by the due course
and process of law.'' By the course and process of law due to him as a free born moral agent and not an
animal. Listen to Edward Coke rule in 1610 in the case Thomas Bonham v College of Physicians: ''And
it appears in our books, that in many cases, the common law will control Acts of Parliament, and
sometimes adjudge them to be utterly void; for when an act of Parliament is against common right and
reason, or repugnant, or impossible to be performed, the common law will control it, and adjudge such
an  Act  to  be  void.  Some  statutes  are  made  against  law  and  right,  which  those  who  made  them
perceiving,  would  not  put  them in  execution.''  Laws  passed  by correct  legislative  procedures  are
nonetheless invalid if they violate common reason, common law, common right, common fairness and
common justice. Due process of law, the doctrine which ensures that laws are not only procedurally
valid but are fair and just, and empowers courts to nullify laws if they are unfair and unjust, means that
no person shall be deprived of his life, liberty or property unless he commits an act of force or fraud
against another. A law which deprives a person of his life, liberty or property in the absence of any
commission of force or fraud is inherently unfair and unjust, or else the notions of fairness and justice
mean nothing whatever. A law which deprives a person who did not commit any act or force or fraud
against another of his rights is a law which says that nothing is due to a person. It denies the fact that a
person is born free and in possession of rights; he is not born into a state of slavery in possession of no
rights; and being a free born person, he has processes of law due to him or owed to him as a free
person. The process of law due to him and owed to him as a free person is the requirement that he not
be deprived of his rights if he has done no harm to another person and not committed an act of force or
fraud. Due process of law means that a person may not be deprived of his life unless he has committed
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an act of force or fraud. It means he may not be deprived of his liberty unless he has committed an act
of force or fraud. It means that he may not be deprived of his property unless he has committed an act
of force or fraud. It means he has the right to freely conduct a business, to discriminate on the basis of
gender, race or any other category on his own property or in his own business, to freely buy or sell his
labor, to work or not to work, to speak freely, and to move where he wants to move and live where he
wants to live, unless he has committed an act of force or fraud. It means that the state cannot create a
category of victimless crimes or crimes in which no person can be shown to have been the victim of
force or fraud. It means that a woman has a right to get an abortion unless she has committed an act or
force or fraud, on the grounds that a one cell zygote which appears at the moment of human conception
is not a person and is not equal to a forty trillion cell, actual, born human being. It is not a person in the
judgment of people with sane minds and functioning eyes. It is not a person because there is no such
thing as a supernatural soul, a entity which exists by virtue of the fact that it cannot be seen, and a
person is not blind when he sees because he does not see the highest reality. Because the zygote which
is created at the moment of conception is not a person, its destruction is not an act of murder, and
abortion is thus a right. Establishing the right to life, liberty and property, and all the rights these entail,
from the right to freely contract one's services to the right to get an abortion, the principle of due
process  establishes  the  libertarian,  laisser  faire  capitalist  society  envisioned  by  such  English
philosophers as John Locke in his Two Treatises of Government, and Herbert Spencer in his  Social
Statics. In the nineteenth century, the principle of due process conceived as a principle of fairness and
justice establishing a libertarian society was rejected in Britain, and in the twentieth century during the
New Deal, it was rejected in America. In both nations, the principle of due process was reinterpreted to
refer only to procedural correctness in the enactment of laws, and the principle of processes due to a
person  by virtue  of  the  fact  that  he  is  born  free  was  replaced  by the  principle  of  parliamentary
supremacy,  the  common  good,  the  ''organic  character  of  the  law''  and  brazen  mob  rule.  In  the
totalitarian order which has spread throughout the West in the twenty first century, no processes of
fairness or justice are held to be due to a person by virtue of the fact that he is born free, and all the
rights guaranteed to him in a libertarian society are held to be repealable by the legislature. In the
totalitarian order which has spread throughout the West in the twenty first century, it is held to be fair
and just to deprive a person of his rights to life, liberty and property although he has committed no
harm against  any other,  simply  if  the  correct  procedures  are  followed  in  the  deprivation.  In  the
totalitarian order which has spread throughout the West in the twenty first century, the category of
victimless crimes, pseudocrimes which have ensnared everyone from Donald Trump, forced to pay a
fine of a half a billion dollars to New York State for an act of overvaluation of loan collateral which
defrauded no banks, to a shop owner who seeks to discriminate on the basis of race or gender in his
own shop, to a woman seeking to get an abortion, has composed the sorry epitaph of civilization. 

BLACK POWER VERSUS THE CLASSICS

Bildersturm. Beeldenstorm. Furie Iconoclaste. The  Great  Iconoclasm.  These  are  names  in  four
languages for a terrifying outbreak of destruction which occurred in Europe in the sixteenth century.
Entering Catholic churches, mobs of Protestants smashed and defaced artworks, church fittings, church
libraries and church decorations in a wave of vandalism which left the churches gutted, bare and empty.
The mobs left no nation untouched and their brazen criminality, sweeping from Scotland through to
Switzerland to the Low Countries to the Holy Roman Empire, was the shame of Europe. In the twenty
first century, the vandals are back in business with only the colors and flags changed. Today's vandals
are black power activists  and their  target is  the study of the Greco-Roman classics in universities,
symbols of the rationalist culture which they hate and despise with a fury which knows no bounds.
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Today's vandals are a part of a monster which has been on the loose in the West since the mid twentieth
century. This monster emerged from the depths of a religion founded in the nineteenth century by Karl
Marx.  The  religion  he  founded  was  tribalism  and  it  championed  the  class  above  the  individual,
constructed a master class called the proletariat, and advocated the extermination of an enemy class
called the bourgeois. In the mid twentieth century, the founder's class tribalism was complemented by
two additions,  by gender  tribalism and race  tribalism,  and together  these three religions  formed a
nightmare creature called  Gender, Race and Class Politics brought to life by the surging currents of
Marxist electricity.  It left the laboratory,  located in the dark mountains of hate, and has been on a
rampage for the past half century. In the present day, the black power face of this monster has declared
war on the study of the classics. Look at its campaign of vandalism and see the Marxist gravediggers of
civilization finish their task and plant a tombstone on the grave of the West, reading Death By Mental
Collapse. Listen to the neoMarxist voices of black power proclaim that progressive political theory is
called critical race theory. According to this theory, the legacies of the Enlightenment, reason, science
and liberal democracy, must be criticized from the standpoint of race and be replaced by a regime of
race Marxism and the promotion of black swastika politics. A progressive society is ruled by a black
master race which has expropriated whites of all their wealth, deprived them of all their rights and put
them into  concentration camps.  Listen  to  the  neoMarxist  voices  of  black  power proclaim that  the
classics of Greco-Roman literature are pages of white supremacy and must be burned. Greco-Roman
statues are carved representations of white supremacy and must be smashed. Greco-Roman culture was
a lash of white colonialism and it must be vilified. The Greco-Roman values of  universalism, objective
truth  and  human essentialism,  which  regards  man  as  a  rational  animal,  are  pretentious,  dogmatic,
dangerous and opposed to  the true reality of  race,  and the  differences  between races,  which  flow
inexorably  through  the  currents  of  history  and  alone  give  meaning  to  life.  A progressive  society
downgrades  human reason and elevates  race as  the  foundation of  human existence.  A progressive
university has eliminated the study of universal human values and teaches students the primacy of race
and ethnicity in the determination of truth and morality. The Greco-Roman doctrine of universal truth is
a white supremacist ideology. The highest form of scholarship is politicized scholarship which studies,
researches, transmits and agitates for the gospel of black racial supremacy. The study of the classics is
the  study  of  whiteness  and  must  be  abolished.  A progressive  university  is  managed  by  masters,
mentors, associates, postdoctoral assistants and full professors forming an army dedicated, one and all,
to indoctrinating students in the religion of race, blood and the black will to power.  A progressive
society  is  a  racialized  society  which  has  abolished  individual  rights,  disenfranchised  the  white
population,  and voted a black communist  dictatorship into power.  Capitalism is a system of white
settler colonialism. The study of the classics must be transformed into an assault on the classics in the
name of racial inclusion, racial scholarship and a communist color revolution. A progressive university
is a training program in which students develop the skills necessary to disrupt classrooms, occupy
campuses, foment riots in the streets and overthrow free institutions in the name of black power. The
highest form of teaching and scholarship is racist teaching and racist scholarship which manufactures
historical  falsehoods  about  whites  and  stirs  up  hatred  toward  them.  A progressive  university  is  a
conference  on  race  whose  aim  is  the  disparagement  of  whites  and  the  promotion  of  antiwhite
discrimination.  Liberal democracy is synonymous with systemic racism and must be replaced by a
regime of black prejudice and black obsession with race. The study of the classics is antiminority and
antiblack and must be replaced by drumbeats of black communist politics. The traditional requirement
that students of the classics learn to speak Greek and Latin is a product of white racism and unfairly
discriminates against racist black students who properly hate all things white. A progressive university
has  been  demographically  transformed  to  eliminate  white  capitalists  and  include  only  black
communists. A progressive university has placed a black communist  professoriate in charge of the
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classics and given it a mandate to discredit the classical search for universal truth, goodness and beauty.
The study of the classics discriminates against marginalized minority groups such as poor blacks. A
progressive university teaches that nothing has universal value, nothing is universal in man, nothing is
universally true, good, decent or noble, and a progressive society is constructed on the foundations of
race, ethnicity and particularity, and has nullified the traditions and institutions defended by civilized
people for thousands of years: ''Critical race theory will be applied to the classics thanks to a $1 million
grant  given  to  two  Ivy  League  professors.  The  Mellon  Foundation  granted  the  funds  to  Brown
University Professor Sasha-Mae Eccleston and Dan-el Peralta,  a Princeton University professor, for
their Racing the Classics fellowship. Neither responded to two emailed requests for comment sent in
the past two weeks. The College Fix asked for more information on the program, including if the goal
was to inspire activism against current representations of classics. Specifically, The Fix asked about
a failed effort at Brown to remove Greek and Roman statues on campus because they represented white
supremacy.  Activists  called  their  campaign  'one  step  in  a  broader  project  of  decolonization  by
confronting Brown’s institutional and ideological legacies of colonialism and white supremacy.' The
fellowship program, which will begin in 2025, continues a project the two began with a conference in
2017.  'The  inaugural  event  invited  participants  to  unabashedly  center  race  and  ethnicity  in  their
research in order to counter the dangerously universalizing pretensions of Western Civilization and
other white supremacist ideologies suffusing the academy,' a description states. It is the latest part of
their  scholarship  to  study  race  and  the  classics.  Eccleston  'directs  the  Critical  Classical  Studies
Postdoctoral/Post  MFA Fellowship  Program,’ according to  her  university bio.  Padilla  is  critical  of
'whiteness'  in the classics.  The new program will  be a 'multiyear fellowship program designed to
mentor  graduate  students  and early career  researchers  of  the ancient  Mediterranean as  they center
critical race studies in their scholarship and teaching,' according to a Princeton announcement. The pair
said their work is important, particularly during a time of 'multipronged and multidimensional assaults
against racialized communities, and on the teaching of race and settler colonialism.' Princeton President
Christopher Eisgruber personally endorsed the project. 'The proposed program will transform the study
of classics in significant ways and build a sustainable community of scholars committed to inclusive
and collaborative scholarship,'  the president said.  The university’s classics department removed the
Greek  and  Latin  requirement  from the  major  to  combat  'systemic  racism,'  as previously  reported
by The Fix. 'By providing scholars from historically minoritized groups and those committed to the
project’s  priorities  with  the  support  of  a  community, Racing the Classics aims  to  contribute  to  the
demographic transformation of the professoriate in classics,' the Princeton news release states. But a
political scientist at Boise State University questioned the value of the program. 'We turn to the classics
in order to have our prejudices challenged, not simply to confirm them,' Professor Scott Yenor told The
Fix via email. 'The classics among the Greeks spoke to the universal in man, not to the particularities
that obsess us today. Clearly it is the job of teachers to ensure that minorities and really all students take
the ideas of the great authors seriously, instead of only paying attention to our strange obsession with
race and ethnicity.'  ''  (Professors Get $1 million To Apply Critical Race Studies To The Classics by
Brandy Perez). In 1582, Pope Gregory XIII commissioned Sicilian painter Tomasso Laureti to produce
a fresco for the Vatican Palace. Completed in 1585,  The Triumph Of The Christian Religion shows a
smashed  pagan  statue  lying  in  the  shadow  of  an  elevated  image  of  Christ.  Over  the  succeeding
centuries, smashing in the name of religion would continue. In the twentieth century, the successors of
the Christians, the Marxists, began smashing the traditions and institutions of freedom. In the twenty
first century, the black power branch of Marxism continued the campaigns of the early Christians and
took a hammer to the study of ancient Greece and Rome. 
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MENGELE ALIVE

Into whatever houses  I  enter,  I  will  enter  to  help the sick,  and I  will  abstain from all  intentional
wrongdoing and harm, especially from abusing the bodies of man or woman, slave or free. Thus speaks
the most famous words in the Hippocratic Oath. Composed in the fourth century BC by the Greek
physician Hippocrates, the father of medicine, it is the oath taken by physicians throughout the world
when  they start  their  careers.  It  is  enshrined  in  legal  statutes  and  violations  of  it  carry  criminal
punishment. He was capable of being so kind to the children, to have them become fond of him, to
bring them sugar, to think of small details in their daily lives, and to do things we would genuinely
admire. And then, next to that, the crematoria smoke, and these children, tomorrow or in a half hour, he
is  going  to  send  them  there.  Well,  that  is  where  the  anomaly  lay.  Thus  speaks  a  prisoner  at  the
Auschwitz concentration camp, describing Josef Mengele, a physician at the camp. Called the Angel of
Death,  Mengele  performed  deadly  medical  experiments  on  prisoners,  selected  victims  for  gas
chambers, and administered the poison gas. Wanted by West Germany, Israel and holocaust investigator
Simon Weisenthal, Mengele eluded capture, and in 1979, he died of natural causes at the age of sixty
seven in  Bertioga,  Brazil.  In  1985,  his  mortal  remains  were disinterred and identified by forensic
examination, but his spirit had long since moved on to inhabit new realms. His spirit was the principle
of political  medicine,  the principle  of  medicine placed in the service of ideology,  the principle  of
medicine  reduced  to  a  handmaiden  of  religion,  the  principle  of  medicine  practiced  as  a  criminal
enterprise which mocks the Hippocratic Oath as it burns its vow of nonaggression to smoke and ashes.
His spirit was born in a pool of darkness which had spread across the West in the twentieth century.
This pool of darkness was a nightmare creature called Gender, Race and Class Politics, brought to life
high atop the dark mountains of hate with the surging lightning bolts of Marxism. The spirit of Josef
Mengele is alive and well in the world and travels anyplace there is hate and anyplace which rejects
liberal  values.  It  has  entered  medical  schools  and  made  every  every  doctor  there  a  Doctor  Josef
Mengele.  The  new  Josef  Mengeles  have  changed  their  colors  and  flags  but  practice  the  same
discrimination and commit the same crimes. They have removed their swastikas and donned flags and
colors  marked  diversity,  equity  and  inclusion,  and  preach  Hitler's  tribalism,  neoMarxism,  national
socialism and antienlightenment  with  a  new set  of  masters  and new new set  of  victims.  Look  at
medical schools today and see the spread of a cancer of discrimination against whites justified in the
name  of  diversity  and  inclusion.  See  color  counting  justified  as  the  search  for  diversity.  See  the
inclusion of blacks as patients, blacks as students and blacks as professors and the inclusion of nobody
else. See racist medicine called equitable medicine and nonracist medicine called inequitable medicine.
See the rejection of merit based selection of doctors and the promotion of race based selection. See
medical treatment reserved exclusively for blacks in a policy of letting sick whites suffer and die. See
the refusal to treat sick people who are white, male and successful. See the rejection of excellence in
medicine, skill in medicine and professionalism in medicine in favor of selection on the basis of skin
pigmentation  and  the  deployment  of  doctors  to  advance  far  left  politics  and  a  communist  color
revolution:  ''Diversity,  equity,  and inclusion (DEI) efforts are the 'most divisive, horrible cancer'  in
medical school, Representative Greg Murphy (R-NC), a doctor, said during an appearance on Breitbart
News Daily. Murphy explained that medicine became very political during the coronavirus pandemic,
and now, that way of thinking is overtaking higher education—namely, medical school. Murphy said:
'And this  is  where  it  is  supposed to  be  something that  is  truly objective,  truly merit  based,  truly
demanding of excellence for our patients. And now it’s being polluted, as you point out, with the cancer
of DEI. We are now treating individuals in different categories. You have people that are saying, I
won’t take care of a person of one race or another, or that it saddens me when I meet somebody like
this. It is the most divisive, horrible, cancer that could ever happen in medicine. That’s a mindset. And
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you know, we won’t see this really until almost a decade because they’re just really getting started now
in medical schools. But, you know, there’s always, truly, the wonderful thing of being able to take care
of patients where they are, you know, we know of a lot of poor individuals, a lot of folks who have
problems with access to care—that’s never been the issue. We always used to demand excellence from
our doctors. We want the smartest damn person possible or the most skillful surgeon possible. And now
our medical schools are now inserting in a—in a time when there is an explosion of information. All of
a sudden, we have to have diversity of classes,' he said, emphasizing that things are now based on skin
color and other factors. Murphy briefly discussed his bill that would essentially say that schools with
DEI programs would not receive funding from the federal government. 'I spent my entire life studying
hard in, you know, high school and college and everything like that to be a physician and then to be the
most excellent physician I can be. Those standards should never be compromised because we have to
placate  the  far  left  in  their  DEI  cancerous  initiatives,  divisive  initiatives.'  ''  (Representative.  Greg
Murphy:  DEI ‘Most  Divisive,  Horrible  Cancer’ In Medical  School by Hannah Knudsen).  Look at
medical schools today and see the establishment of black based standards and feminist based standards
in place of merit based standards in the selection of students. See a policy of preferential treatment
given to women and blacks justified in the name of diversity, inclusion and the highest form of fairness
and  equity.  See  America's  medical  schools  and  associations  of  medical  schools  transformed  into
political  indoctrination  and  selection  centers  fomenting  race  and  gender  wars.  See  the  traditional
selection of quality medical students replaced by the selection of students based on skin color. See
black and women students alone held to be good, worthy and deserving of admission. See admissions
policies placed under the control of demographics, and the recruitment of blacks and women into a
woke, affirmative action army whose mission is to subvert liberal order: ''Just how woke is your nearest
medical school? Likely very woke—yet the organization that helps oversee medical schools thinks it’s
not woke enough. So says the Association of American Medical Colleges, which last week released the
first ever analysis of the extent to which 'diversity, equity and inclusion' have infected the institutions
training future physicians. I’ve covered this trend for years, but even I didn’t realize just how much
patients should worry about the decline in standards and, in time, the quality of their own care. The
AAMC surveyed 101 institutions, representing almost two thirds of American medical schools (two are
in Canada), asking for audits of their DEI related policies and programs. While the AAMC doesn’t
appear to have released a list of participating schools, my organization discovered the audits’ existence
in October, when Ohio State University included the document prepared by its College of Medicine in
response to our freedom of information request. The AAMC asked medical schools to answer 89 yes or
no questions on whether they have specific DEI activities. The results are shown as a kind of report
card. Schools that score 80% are colored green, and those that score between 61% and 80% are yellow.
Institutions below the 60% threshold are red—a sign of failure. Medical schools should fear a failing
grade from the AAMC, which helps determine whether they get accredited. As a former associate dean,
I can attest that when the AAMC sets priorities, administrators rush to follow them. All told, more than
six out of 10 medical schools scored 80%. The Ohio State University College of Medicine audit shows
a score of 93%, making it one of the most woke medical schools in America. Crucially, no institution
scored lower than 50%—meaning virtually every medical  school  is  implementing at  least  half  the
policies woke activists want.'' (Med Schools Are Even More Woke Than You Think—And Your Care Is
At Risk by Stanley Goldfarb). High atop the dark mountains of hate is a laboratory. It is illuminated by
electrical arcs, cluttered with test tubes and watched over by faces formed from dials and controls. It is
manned by doctors who have rejected the traditions and institutions of the Enlightenment. They are
comprised exclusively of black communists and women communists and they wear the coats of race
politics,  gender  politics,  social  justice  politics  and  hatred  of  successful  white  males.  Look  at  the
medical schools churning out these mad doctor activists:  ''The plan here is not to teach the students
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anything that  will  improve the  health  of  their  patients  but  rather  to  have  students  who ultimately
become physicians, put on their white coats and march into various political meetings to claim health
consequences as the rationale for political activism.'' (UCLA Medical Student Says Left Wing Ideology
‘Laced Through All  Four Years’ Of School,  Fox New, March 24, 2024, quoting Stanley Goldfarb).
Contravening the sacred Hippocratic Oath, the antimorality of doctors today is  first do harm  and in
their medical bags are the drugs and tools of world revolution. 

BRIDGE COLLAPSES INTO DEI WATERS

On March 26, 2024, at 1:28 AM Eastern Daylight Time, in Baltimore, Maryland, the Francis Scott Key
Bridge collapsed into the Patapsco River and Baltimore Harbor it spanned, after it had been struck by
the  container  ship Dali.  All  members  of  the  bridge's  maintenance  crew were  killed.  The collapse
blocked the  Port  of  Baltimore,  one  of  the  busiest  ports  in  the  world,  and brought  about  a  global
economic crisis. The port handled a half a million passengers per year and fifty two million tons of
foreign cargo worth eighty billion dollars. It was a leading port for coal, automobiles and light trucks,
handling one million vehicles. It employed fifteen thousand people. The collapse led to the immediate
loss of eight thousand jobs and caused losses of fifteen million dollars per day. The twisted wreckage of
the bridge forms a monster in the waters of the Baltimore Harbor, a monster which has consumed jobs,
careers and businesses and sent out mayday signals describing the collapse of world trade. But it has
done more than this. Civilized people beholding this nightmare shape see gaping spaces and empty eye
sockets spelling out a program, a policy and an ideology of moral regression,  collapse and death.
Brought  to  life  high  atop the  dark mountains  of  tribal  politics  with the surging lightning bolts  of
Marxism, this monster is called  Gender, Race and Class Politics; it is called  Diversity, Equity and
Inclusion; and its violence made the Francis Scott Key Bridge fall to its doom. Amidst the mournful
recovery operations and the howling wail of ambulance sirens, the truth of the collapse stood out stark
and brutal for all who had eyes to see. It stood out as stark and brutal as the blood swirling around the
port's waters and the dead bodies floating down the port's river. The truth of the collapse is that it was
caused by the actions and omissions of personnel hired on the basis of their race and gender and not on
the basis of their talents or abilities. It was caused by personnel hired to fulfill diversity and inclusion
requirements  established  at  the  workplace,  requirements  mandating  acts  of  race  and  gender
discrimination giving preferential treatment to women and blacks, and mandating them as the highest
forms of fairness and equity. The collapse of the Francis Scott Key Bridge was caused by a Marxist
establishment focused on the achievement of workplace diversity and not workplace quality. It was
caused by an establishment which sacrificed the safety of the people and the success of their businesses
upon the altars of race and gender affirmative action. It was caused by an establishment which hired
Karenthia Barber as Commissioner for the Port of Baltimore, a person whose past responsibilities have
no relation to her present remit, and whose sole qualification for her job is the fact that she checks all
the establishment's employment boxes, and is black, female and Marxist. The collapse of the bridge
was caused by an establishment which vilifies those who are opposed to hiring people on the basis of
their race and gender and who demand a policy of race blind, gender blind, nondiscriminatory hiring. It
was caused by an establishment which vilifies these opponents of diversity, equity and inclusion hiring
as biased,  ignorant,  irresponsible,  misguided, antiblack,  antiwoman and pandering to white racism:
''Diversity, equity and inclusion has become such a flashpoint across the country that a politician in
Utah, state Representative Phil Lyman, inferred it was the reason a huge container ship plowed into and
knocked down the Francis Scott Key Bridge in Baltimore, leaving six people presumed dead. 'This is
what happens when you have governors who prioritize diversity over the wellbeing and security of
citizens,' said Lyman, a Republican running for governor, said in   a post on X. Lyman’s post included a
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retweet of the Young Conservative Federation, which wrote: 'Let’s meet the Commissioners for the Port
of Baltimore, starting with Karenthia A. Barber. She knows nothing about Ports, but she is a diversity,
equity, inclusion and belonging (DEIB) auditor and consultant.' Later, Lyman posted DEI=DIE. Barber
is one of  six  commissioners   serving at  least  three year  terms overseeing the  Port  of  Baltimore.  In
addition to work on DEIB training, coaching and consulting, Barber’s bio includes experience teaching
on the university level and being the first female chair of the board of Maryland Automobile Insurance.
The other  five  commissioners’ bios  say they also have  a  range of  career  experience,  including in
maritime  science,  shipping,  the  airline  industry,  corporate  law  and  Maryland’s  department  of
transportation.  DEI  consultant  Nika  White  said  Lyman’s  assertions  were  'not  only  irresponsible,
antiblack and antiwoman but also profoundly misguided.' White added, 'By linking Port of Baltimore
Commissioner Karenthia Barber’s background to the accident solely because of her involvement with
DEI efforts, conservatives like Lyman reveal their bias, ignorance, and willingness to say anything for
votes.'  ''  (Utah Lawmaker Blames 'Diversity'  For Baltimore Bridge Collapse by Curtis  Bunn).  The
collapse of the Francis Scott Key Bridge was caused by an establishment which had established racist,
sexist, antiwhite male hiring policies. It was caused by a racist,  sexist, anti white male world view
called diversity, equity and inclusion. It was caused by Baltimore port commissioners hired on the basis
of their  race and gender and not their  professional competence. It was caused by an establishment
which had set forth diversity requirements for hiring in the place of the traditional requirements that job
applicants demonstrate skillsets. It was caused by an establishment concerned with the comfort, health
and happiness of women, blacks and Marxists and nobody else. It was caused by an establishment
which had sacrificed the safety and security of the infrastructure upon the altar of a race and gender
politics presided over by a master group of black women Marxists: ''Representative Phil Lyman, R-
Blanding is defending a post made Tuesday, that said Diversity, Equity, and Inclusion (DEI) policies
had something to do with the Baltimore bridge collapse.  He said his post was making a correlation
between the two. Soon after the bridge collapsed, Lyman took to X to reshare a post from an account
called  the  Young  Conservative  Federation.  The  post  claimed  that  commissioners  for  the  port  of
Baltimore  were  merely  hired  based  on  diversity  requirements.  His  repost  added  the  following
statement: 'This is what happens when you have Ggovernors who prioritize diversity over the well
being and security of citizens.' He further went on to post DEI=DIE. Lyman told KSL NewsRadio that
he still stands for this idea, despite the controversy it has caused. Lyman said the post was making a
correlation between DEI policies and the incident. 'The correlation is simply that [Baltimore has] a
robust DEI program that oversees the port, that oversees the bridge, and they had a catastrophe that was
either  intentional  or  unintentional.'  He said his  post  should let  people  know that  his  gubernatorial
campaign doesn’t support DEI at all. 'We’re not proponents of DEI, we’re not proponents of hiring
people based on DEI, or implementing DEI in Utah at our universities, at our schools,' Lyman said.
'When those types of things influence policy, often the outcomes are not what we would have hoped.
This  was  a  bad  outcome.  DEI  was  a  high  priority  for  this  county  and  this  port,  and  that’s  the
correlation.'  ''  (Representative Phil  Lyman Defends Post Corrrelating DEI Policies With Baltimore
Bridge Collapse by Emma Keddington). The collapse of the Francis Scott Key Bridge was caused by
an establishment  which  had hired  black  men and black  women as  Baltimore  Port  Commissioners
because they were black men and black women. It was caused by an establishment which led race and
gender politics, coached race and gender politics, consulted in race and gender politics, trained in race
and gender politics, and had ordered failures of infrastructure, and the ensuing disasters and deaths, to
be  committed  by the  blacks  and women it  placed in  charge,  hired  under  its  diversity,  equity and
inclusion  policies:  ''Utah  Republican  Phil  Lyman,  an  outgoing  state  representative  and  current
gubernatorial  candidate,  suggested  diversity,  equity  and  inclusion  programs  were  to  blame  for
the collapse of the Francis Scott Key Bridge in Baltimore on Tuesday. 'This is what happens when you
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have governors who prioritize diversity over the well being and security of citizens,' reads a post from
Lyman’s account over pictures of Karenthia Barber and Sandy Roberts, a black man and woman who
serve as Maryland Port Commissioners. Lyman stood by the sentiment and said he wasn’t going to
apologize  or  retract  the  post. 'I’m not  posting  her  because  she’s  a  black  woman,  I’m posting  her
because she’s an auditor of DEI,' he said, referring to Barber’s career history providing 'leadership and
workforce training, coaching, and diversity, equity and inclusion audits and consulting.' 'I’m saying
you’ve got this DEI initiative that’s going in these places and then you clearly have human failures that
create a disaster like this.' '' (Lyman Blames DEI For Baltimore Bridge Collapse by Kyle Dunphey).
Sabotage can outweigh production. If you question it—report it. United States Army. Sabotage means
to push back, pull out or break off the fangs of capitalism. W. D. Haywood. We use economic sabotage
and guerrilla warfare to stop the exploitation and destruction of the environment. Earth Liberation
Front.  Sabotage:  a  deliberate  action aimed at  destroying a  society through subversion.  For  over  a
century, the West has been under attack by saboteurs swearing allegiance to Marxism. Their colors and
flags have changed but their mission remains the same: the destruction of the traditions and institutions
of the Enlightenment. Promoting gender, race and class discrimination in the name of diversity, equity,
inclusion and belonging,  today's  saboteurs have placed black women communists  in  charge of the
infrastructure of  civilization.  On March 26, 2024, these saboteurs  collapsed the Francis  Scott  Key
Bridge in Baltimore, Maryland and added one more trophy to the victors' chariots. 

DEI MISSILES DOWN BOEING FLEET

I love you, and you should feel free to move on. Thus wrote Eliot Trexler to his wife while he was on
board a United Airlines Boeing 737 flight en route from Houston, Texas to Fort Myers, Florida on
March 4, 2024. The engine of the airplane had caught fire and the passengers saw Death stalk the
aisles. Boeing, crash, grounding: the words have become synonymous in the twenty first century and
formed  a  pool  of  shame into  which  this  storied  American  multinational  corporation  has  plunged.
Boeing: one of the world's largest aerospace manufacturers, the fourth largest defense contractor in the
world, and the largest exporter in America. Boeing: founded over a century ago on July 15, 1916, in
Seattle, Washington by William Boeing, and at present, earning over eighty billion dollars in sales, and
ranking  54th  on  the  Fortune  500 list  and  121st  on  the Fortune  Global  500  list.  Boeing:  the
everexpanding list of accidents and incidents involving its aircraft in the twenty first century has not
only crashed and grounded its fleet but exposed with brutal clarity the deadly terror attacks the West is
under. These attacks have shattered the traditions and institutions of the Enlightenment and installed a
nightmare  creature  in  their  place.  The  chaos  on  board  Boeing's  flights,  the  turbulence  roiling  the
aircraft,  the plumes of smoke engulfing the cabin, the flashes of light dazzling the passengers, the
explosions shattering their ears, the shattered glass lacerating their flesh, the downward plunge into
terror creating a state without mass or weight, and the screams and cries of the panic stricken, the
wounded and the dying, have spelled out the two fearsome names of this creature and inscribed the
sorry epitaph of the West. Its names are Gender, Race and Class Politics and  Diversity, Equity and
Inclusion, and it has placed saboteurs in the infrastructure of civilization and given them orders to blow
it up. Assembled and brought to life atop dark mountains of hate with the surging lightning bolts of
Marxism, it is a program, a policy and a religion of racism and sexism which mandates discrimination
against  white  males  and targets them for extermination.  Look at  this  nightmare creature at  eleven
thousand meters and see what it has done to a company once respected as an innovator, pioneer and
trendsetter in the field of aviation. It has placed the traditional goals of Boeing of producing quality
airplanes in an ejector seat and jettisoned them from a company plunging into the abyss of gender, race
and class politics. It has proclaimed that a progressive airplane company gives preferential treatment to
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women and blacks in the name of achieving diversity and inclusion and calls this policy of race and
gender discrimination the highest form of fairness and equity.  It has proclaimed that a progressive
airplane company hires women and blacks because they are women and blacks and shunts aside the
safety of its airplanes in the pursuit of its policy of race and gender discrimination. It has proclaimed
that a progressive airplane company is an indoctrination camp whose hangars, laboratories, boardrooms
and corporate suites serve as ideological echo chambers for the high speed propagation of pronouns,
party  lines  and  political  correctness  mandated  by  Marxism.  It  has  proclaimed  that  a  progressive
airplane company has sacrificed corporate performance upon the altar social justice and swept vital
indexes  of  performance,  schedule  performance  and cost  performance,  into  a  dustbin  with  brooms
marked race and gender quotas. It has proclaimed that a progressive airplane company is a church and
congregation whose mission is to persuade its staff by constant drumbeats of repetition to believe that
the roots of all evil and the poisoners of the world are the population of white males, and Hitler's gas
chambers must be restarted to receive them. It has proclaimed that a progressive airplane company
manufactures  airplanes  whose  purpose  is  to  kill  passengers,  airplanes  designed  and  assembled  by
blacks and women. It has proclaimed that a progressive airplane company hires blacks and women as
mechanics and engineers not because they possess the requisite skillsets but because they are blacks
and women. It has proclaimed that a progressive airplane company condemns as racist and sexist all
those opposed to racist and sexist affirmative action programs. It has proclaimed that a progressive
airplane company condemns all those opposed to discrimination against white males as antiimmigrant,
antiblack,  antifemale,  antipoor,  antienvironment and antiEarth.  It  has proclaimed that a progressive
airplane company has nothing to do with manufacturing airplanes which are safe or with protecting the
safety of its employees, but pays its executives to promote Marxist politics and ensure that only blacks
and women are hired, and that civilization is dismantled in order to stop greenhouse gas emissions:
''Observers of recent near disasters in the airline industry are beginning to link the industry’s troubles to
efforts to implement diversity, equity, and inclusion initiatives in aviation companies’ hiring practices
rather than prioritizing safety. The narrowly averted disaster involving a Boeing passenger plane in
Houston was the latest in a string of incidents that have brought scrutiny to Boeing. On Monday, one of
the engines of a United Airlines Boeing 737 en route from Houston to Fort Myers, Florida, caught on
fire within minutes of takeoff. This resulted in a terrifying ordeal for the 167 passengers on board
before  the  plane  was  able  to  safely  return  to  George  Bush  Intercontinental  Airport  in  Houston.
Footage obtained by the  New York Post taken through one of the plane’s windows appears to show
flames  flashing  out  of  the  engine  in  the  otherwise  dark  sky.  Passengers described  the  harrowing
experience on Flight 1118 to ABC 13: 'I remember there was just this bright, flashing light that came
through the window, and it sounded like a bomb went off, and then it was just a strobe of fire out the
window,'  passenger  David  Gruninger  said,  describing  how  the  nightmare  began.  'The  plane  was
nosediving, and the pilot was bringing the plane back up,' passenger Elliot Trexler said. 'The plane was
also rocking back and forth a lot. I think it’s fair to say we all thought we were going to die.' Trexler
said he emailed his wife, 'I love you, and you should feel free to move on.' 'It just turned into chaos.
People were screaming and crying and trying to figure out what was going on,' Gruninger said. 'It was
our left engine, our number one engine, that was surging when we were climbing through about 10,000
[feet],  and  flight  attendants  saw  momentary  flames  back  there,'  a  pilot  explained  on  the  radio
transmission from the plane. Gruninger described the descent as 'a very turbulent ride back, and it was
a pretty harsh landing.' Passengers reportedly received an email from United Airlines that provided
$200 worth of credit and a $15 meal voucher and were placed on another flight to Fort Myers later that
evening. This incident comes on the heels of another incident involving a Boeing plane on February 28,
when an American Airlines intercontinental flight from New York to Madrid had to be rerouted to
Boston due to a crack in the plane’s windshield. It marked the latest in a trend of high profile air travel
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safety incidents that have raised concerns about Boeing’s 737 Max manufacturing and other airline
maintenance issues. A profile on X with the handle Kieth M claimed to have formerly worked at Boeing
and said the following in response to the aborted New York to Madrid flight: 'I resigned from Boeing
because of their DEI indoctrination. How about you stop pushing DEI and pronouns?!? You guys act
like  you  build  vacuum  cleaners.  Live  and  die  on  SPI/CPI  [schedule  performance  index/cost
performance  index].  Building/Maintaining  aircraft  is  a  human  activity.  Treat  your  mechanics  and
engineers with the respect they have earned with their skillsets. Stop focusing on indoctrination. The
suits need to be fired! #Boeingkills #Boeing #DEIkills If it’s Boeing, I’m not going!' Another X poster,
Todd Snyder, claimed, '#Boeing uses less qualified workers due to #DEI a practice that is going to
KILL  somebody!'  Others,  however,  took  to  social  media  to  accuse  those  pointing  to  DEI  of
scapegoating and outright racism. 'It’s genuinely insidious how the 'blame DEI for every societal ill
rhetoric'  mirrors  the  ‘illegal  immigrants  are  taking our  jobs’ line  from the  early 2000s.  I’ve  seen
everything from the Boeing plane debacles to games blamed on this imaginary villain,' said journalist
Matt Kim in a post on X. Still, Boeing’s own 2022 public filings show that executive bonuses are now
tied to hitting DEI and climate targets. In 2021, annual incentive plans were solely based on 'product
safety, employee safety, and quality. Upon this revelation, Elon Musk took to  X and asked, 'Do you
want  to  fly  in  an  airplane  where  they  prioritized  DEI  hiring  over  your  safety?  That  is  actually
happening.' '' (Is Boeing Prioritizing DEI Over Safety? by Andrew Afifian). On September 11, 2001,
four coordinated Islamist terror attacks carried out by Al Qaeda struck America. On that day, nineteen
terrorists hijacked four commercial airliners and crashed airplanes into the Twin Towers of the World
Trade Center in New York City and into the headquarters of the United States Department of Defense
in Arlington, Virginia. The attacks killed 3000 people and were the deadliest terror attacks in history.
Two decades after these attacks, the terror has not subsided but has intensified. The attacks have come
from a Marxist-Islamist axis arrayed against a common enemy, liberal democracy. Missiles launched by
Marxists  carry  labels  and  markings  which  identify  them.  They  include  the  following. Increase
representation among underrepresented groups.  Promote racism, sexism and policies discriminating
against white males in the name of achieving diversity, equity and inclusion.  Ignore qualifications,
skills and intelligence in the selection of job candidates and focus on their race and gender. These
missiles have downed Boeing's fleet. 

3000 AD

The wind constantly howls. Farmland is churned up. Streets lie buried in rubble. Cities are reduced to
wastelands. Nations and continents form vast, empty expanses of desolation. An unseen presence stalks
the world. It is the ghost of collapse, the moral, spiritual, political, economic, cultural and civilizational
collapse of mankind, and it has reduced people to the level of starving animals roaming the landscape,
fighting each other over pieces of garbage. The year is 3000 AD and the West has long since ended,
incinerated in a blazing fire which reduced everything of value and vital necessity to civilized people to
smoke and ashes. The West, which once spanned the four corners of the Earth and gave mankind the
greatest  blessings  of  all,  the  traditions  and  institutions  of  reason,  science,  freedom,  law  and
enlightenment, was torn apart by internal enemies which had rejected reason and championed religion
in its place. These enemies did not crash through the gates of civilization but tore them down from
within, tore them down with guns, bombs, knives and axes supplied to them by the masses. The West
rotted away and exploded into oblivion at  the hands of  warring camps within which had rejected
reason. Ancient Rome had its enemies of reason which subjected it to decay and disintegration. Its
avatars of unreason were divided into two camps, and these camps formed a pincer movement which
surrounded and strangled the Roman Republic and established a degenerate Roman Empire in its place.
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These camps were comprised of those who rejected mind in favor of matter, and those who rejected
matter in favor of a supernatural dimension. The camps of reductive materialists  and otherworldly
mystics brought forth waves of destruction against the traditional Rome of the Senate, the Constitution
and pagan reason. Commencing in the third century AD, the camp of reductive materialists brought
forth class wars, street brawls, bread and circuses, welfare grain doles, bureaucratic administration,
confiscatory taxation, millions of people on the public payroll, government control of wages, profits,
prices,  jobs,  farmland  and  farming  activity,  the  relentless  tyranny  of  casaers,  emperors  and  their
screaming mobs,  and tolerance  granted  to  Germanic barbarians  originating from Northern  Europe.
Commencing in the fourth century AD, the camp of otherworldly mystics brought forth a Christian
movement originating from the East, whose members followed their Jewish Christ, their Jewish God,
their Jewish Son of God and their Jewish Messiah into the madness of a new Jewish religion. This
neoJewish Christian movement was accepted and tolerated by a degenerate society and allowed to
establish its creed as the state religion and to persecute paganism. Today's Enemies Of Reason. The
year is now 3000 AD and the West has long since passed over into a Dark Age, whose masters are the
same  camps  of  reductive  materialists  and  otherworldly  mystics  which  sent  Rome  decaying  and
exploding  into  oblivion.  The  same camps  with  only the  colors  and  flags  changed.  Their  mission
remains the same: the overthrow of reason and the civilization which reason founds. Pages from the
philosophies,  programs and policies of these camps lie  strewn throughout  the streets,  swirling and
floating through the air by the hands of the unceasing winds. Listen to Marxism and its race and gender
evolutions  and  mutations  and  hear  them assume  the  role  of  ancient  Rome's  mobs,  caesars,  state
worshipers and settled barbarians.  Listen to a resurgent Christianity,  a resurgent Orthodox Judaism
together with a radical environmentalist worship of Mother Earth assume the role of ancient Rome's
original Christians. Listen to Marxism's alliance with an external enemy from the East, the religion of
Islam,  as  they  confront  a  common  enemy.  This  enemy  is  the  traditions  and  institutions  of  the
Enlightenment. Listen to them all, listen to this witches' brew of moral and spiritual destruction, and
hear Satan enter the inner sanctum and temple of reason and blow it up. Marxism and Islam. The
Marxist-Islamist axis which overthrew civilization proclaimed that capitalism is a system of structural
racism. It proclaimed that a progressive society is a Hamas society and a terror society which has
exterminated Jews in a holocaust called Free, Free Palestine. It proclaimed that a progressive society is
a  mystical,  nonsecular  society  which  bows  down  in  prayers  and  reverence  to  Mama  Earth.  It
proclaimed that  the  extermination  of  Israel  and Jews  is  an  act  of  justice  because  Israel  and Jews
represent capitalism. It proclaimed that a progressive society is a black society,  a brown society,  a
feminist society, an antisemitic society, an anticapitalist society, a society for the homeless, a society
which has abolished freedom and private property, a society which discriminates against whites in the
name of fairness and equity, a collectivist swampland ruled by women, nonwhites, the poor and the
Palestinians. It proclaimed that the laws of logic and the method of empiricism represent white science
and must be replaced by a mysticism of race, soil and native tribes and ancestors. It proclaimed that a
progressive society is an anticapitalist roadmap to totalitarian dictatorship. It proclaimed that America
is illegally occupied by capitalist society and must be returned to the stagnant eons and savage plains of
the  Indians:  ''In  a  mandatory  course  on  'structural  racism'  for  first  year  medical  students  at  the
University of California Los Angeles, a guest speaker who has praised Hamas’s October 7 attack on
Israel led students in chants of 'Free,  Free Palestine'  and demanded that they bow down to 'Mama
Earth,'  according to students in the class and audio obtained by the Washington Free Beacon.  Lisa
Gray-Garcia, who has referred to the October 7 terrorist attacks as 'justice,' began the March 27 class
by  leading  students  in  what  she  described  as  a  'nonsecular  prayer'  to  'the  ancestors,'  instructing
everyone to get on their knees and touch the floor—'Mama Earth,' as she described it—with their fists.
At least half of the assembled students complied, two students said. Gray-Garcia, a local activist who
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had been invited to speak about 'Housing (In)Justice,' proceeded to thank native tribes for preserving
'what the settlers call LA,' according to audio obtained by the Free Beacon, and to remind students of
the city’s 'herstory.' The prayer also included a benediction for 'black,' 'brown,' and 'houseless people'
who die because of the 'crapatalist lie' of 'private property.' 'Mama Earth,' Gray-Garcia told the kneeling
students, 'was never meant to be bought, sold, pimped, or played.' So began a long and looney lecture
that shocked some students at the elite medical school and has led to calls for an investigation. Wearing
a keffiyeh that covered her entire face, Gray-Garcia, a self described 'poverty scholar,' led the class in
chants of 'Free, Free Palestine' as faculty and staff looked on in silence, according to people in the
course and contemporaneous text messages reviewed by the Free Beacon. One of the onlookers was
Lindsay Wells, a pediatrician at UCLA and the director of the mandatory first year course, Structural
Racism and Health Equity, who did not respond to a request for comment. Gray-Garcia later referred to
modern medicine as 'white science' and inveighed against the 'occupation' of 'Turtle Island'—that is, the
United States—before asking students to stand for a second prayer. This time, nearly everyone rose.
When one student remained seated, according to students in the class, a UCLA administrator, whom
the Free Beacon could not identify, inquired about the student’s identity, implying that discipline could
be on the table.'' (UCLA Med School Requires Students To Attend Lecture Where Speaker Demands
Prayer for ‘Mama Earth,’ Leads Chants of  ‘Free Palestine’ by April  Sibarium).  Christianity. The
resurgent Christian movement which overthrew civilization achieved a stunning victory in a nation
once exalted as the world's arsenal of freedom. It placed the Conference of Catholic Bishops and the
Congregation for the Doctrine of the Faith upon the bench of the Unites States Supreme Court, and
under its auspices, the Court issued a landmark ruling on June 24, 2022. In the case Dobbs vs Jackson
Women's Health Organization, the Court ruled that the First Amendment to the Constitution, which
prohibits the government from establishing religion and constructs a wall of separation between church
and state, does not exist. It ruled that the states have a right to declare that at the moment of a human
conception, at the moment of union of a sperm cell and an ovum cell to form a single cell zygote, an
unborn baby, an actual human person, is created by virtue of the infusion of a supernatural soul, and the
destruction of this single cell is an act of murder. It ruled that states have a right to declare that ordinary
people cannot see this supernatural soul because they are blind, and they are blind because they have
eyes and can see, and those possessed of mystical feeling alone can truly see. On June 24, 2022, the
United  States  Supreme  Court  banged  the  gavel  and  dismissed  one  thousand  years  of  liberal
jurisprudence, and dismissed the Constitution of the United States, from the nation: ''The Constitution
does not confer a right to abortion. Roe and Casey are overruled. The authority to regulate abortion is
returned to the people and their elected representatives.'' Orthodox Judaism. The resurgent Orthodox
Jewish movement which overthrew civilization took control over a nation once exalted as an outpost of
the Enlightenment in the Islamist deserts of the Middle East. It took control of Israel and commenced a
culture war. In this war, it achieved victory and abolished Israel's secular government. Proclaiming that
the preservation of religion is more important than the preservation of innocent human life, it promoted
the settlement of Orthodox Jews in Gaza at the expense of the hostages taken by Hamas in the October
7 terror attacks, and thereby sentenced these hostages to death: ''When Hamas attacked, Israel was
deeply  divided  over  his  government's  right  wing  policies  and  culture  wars  between  secular  and
religious Israelis. They [Orthodox Jewish parties] do not only oppose the mass release of Palestinian
security prisoners to buy the freedom of Israeli hostages, without which a ceasefire will not happen. Mr
Netanyahu's two main ultranationalist allies, Finance Minister Bezalel Smotrich and National Security
Minister Itamar Ben-Gvir, go further. They both want Palestinians to leave Gaza so Jews can settle
there instead. Before October,  Israel's  divisions  must  have made it  look vulnerable to Hamas.  Six
months on, the same schisms within Israel about the present and the future are making it harder to win
the war.'' (Israel-Gaza Briefing: Obstacles To Peace Seem Larger Than Ever After Six Months Of War
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by Jeremy Bowen). Western civilization was born in 1000 AD, a half a century after the collapse of
Classical civilization into the monster maws of religion and barbarism. The first age of the West was a
Dark Age marked by the rule of religion. It emerged from this age and passed through a Renaissance,
an Enlightenment and a Scientific Revolution. In the twenty first century, it traveled full circle and
returned to a  Dark Age ruled by religion.  In  the year  3000 AD, its  ruins  have taught  the naive a
terrifying lesson. They have laid waste to the myth that progress is inevitable.
 

BRITAIN'S ESTABLISHMENT ABOLISHES THE NATION

Julius  Schnoor  von  Carolsfeld  was  German  painter  in  the  nineteenth  century  who  revived  the
Renaissance style in the genre of religious art. His most famous work was created in 1847 and is a
scene from the ancient epic poem Song of the Nibelungs, which forms the basis of Richard Wagner's
opera  Twilight  of  the  Gods.  The  painting  depicts  the  Burgundian  warrior  Hagen  taking  aim  at
Siegfried's back with a spear. The painting depicts the black art of backstabbing, the art of destroying
somebody while pretending friendship with him. It is the black art of duplicity, betrayal and treachery.
In the twenty first century,  the ruling circles of the world's former empire of freedom, the greatest
empire of freedom in modern times,  the successor in  the West  to the Roman Empire of  freedom,
stabbed it in the back. This backstabbing of the nation by the establishment had precedents. A precedent
occurred at the end of World War II, when the establishment surrendered the nation's colonies to the
savage lands  of  Asia  and Africa  which  the  empire  had liberated  in  the  eighteenth  and nineteenth
centuries. In the present backstabbing, the establishment has moved to abolish the preeminent symbol
of the nation in the world, and to redefine the nation's character, and thereby to abolish the nation itself.
The nation is Britain and in October 2023, the leading lights of the British establishment gathered in a
leading city of the establishment, gathered in a leading conference organized by the establishment, and
voted  to  finish  the  work  of  dissolving  Britain,  commenced  in  the  decolonization  movement  eight
decades  before,  and voted to  abolish the Foreign Office  and to  redefine the nation.  The city was
Oxford. The conference was the UK Policy Lab. The participants were ministers, national security
advisors,  permanent  secretaries,  ambassadors  and  senior  officials.  The  leaders  were  Tom Fletcher,
Principal of Hertford College, Oxford, Moazzam Malik, UK Policy Lab Honorary Professor, and Mark
Sedwill,  member  of  the  House  of  Lords.  Look  at  their  conference  and  see  a  sword  of  treason
unsheathed against  the nation by those pretending to be its  friends and guardians.  The conference
proclaimed that the liberal values which founded Britain and defined its existence and its empire for
centuries do not possess universal validity. It proclaimed that Britain must form alliances with nations
not aligned to liberal values. It proclaimed unfree, authoritarian nations are just as legitimate as free,
law abiding nations and the valuation of the latter over the former is a product of Western bigotry and
chauvinism. It proclaimed that the moral and political system of freedom is no better than the moral
and political system of slavery. It proclaimed that since most of the world lives under unfree political
systems,  Britain  must  renounce  its  principles,  respect  these  systems,  and  forge  bonds  of  undying
friendship and support with them. It proclaimed that the international order based on liberal values is a
product of Western colonialism and imperialism and must be abolished. It proclaimed that capitalism is
a system of man made climate change leading to the incineration of the planet in a greenhouse gas
enveloped inferno. It  proclaimed that capitalism is a system which sanctions the irresponsible,  life
threatening use of technology. It proclaimed that the capitalist economic system is unjust, oppressive,
exploitative,  wasteful  and  inefficient.  It  proclaimed  that  the  liberal  political  model  which  Britain
exported to the world and by which it liberated savage peoples is no longer relevant or sustainable in a
world which has embraced the superior values of socialism, sacrifice and mystical interconnection: ''It
is hard to envisage the world being dominated by a singular political and values system. History did not
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end after the Cold War, as Fukuyama had predicted. The global majority is determinedly nonaligned
and not about to be forced into alliances. Western values and dominance of the international order are
being challenged by countries with differing political and value systems–not just authoritarian states
but also well established democracies. Whilst a rules based international order retains wide appeal, the
international landscape will be characterized by shifting issue based alliances driven by national and
local interests. Today, the UK is undoubtedly less politically and economically influential than in the
immediate  aftermath  of  the  Second World  War.  This  trend  is  likely to  continue  given  the  simple
arithmetic  of  demography  and  compound  economic  growth.  Even  as  the  international  order  is
changing,  humanity faces  a  series of  potentially existential  transnational  challenges.  These include
climate  change,  conflict  and  insecurity,  pandemics,  irresponsible  use  of  technology  and  artificial
intelligence, and a global economic system that is seen by many as unjust but also inefficient and
wasteful. Progress toward the (universal) Sustainable Development Goals set for 2030 has stagnated or
fallen into reverse in the face of multiple crises. As national challenges become more transnational
reflecting greater  interconnectedness,  the old established political  models  are  struggling to  provide
solutions.''  (The  World  In  2024:  Renewing  The  UK's  Approach  To  International  Affairs by  Tom
Fletcher, Moazzam Malik and Mark Sedwill). The UK Policy Lab conference proclaimed that Britain's
historical legacy of freedom is without value or significance. It proclaimed that Britain owes its former
colonies  reparations  for the freedom it  gave them and for its  abolition of  the tyrannies which for
centuries had loomed over the people. It proclaimed that Britain owes the world reparations for the
Industrial Revolution it created which made the world flourish as it had never flourished before. It
proclaimed  that  capitalism  is  a  system  of  brazen  violation  of  human  rights.  It  proclaimed  that
capitalism has brought forth catastrophic global climate change through greenhouse gas emissions. It
proclaimed that a progressive society is a closed society based on socialist values, rules and institutions
and Britain must be a leader in the establishment of this society throughout the world: ''We cannot
simply brush aside concerns around the UK’s historical legacy and questions of nationhood. The exit
from the EU has opened many questions, including in Northern Ireland and Scotland. Former colonies
are  making  increasingly  vocal  demands  around  the  need  for  reparations  from  colonialism  and
compensation for the loss and damage arising from historical industrial emissions. Our credibility on
the international stage depends on greater consistency between domestic and international policies. As
an  open and  highly interconnected  economy and  society,  the  UK’s  future  security  and  prosperity
depends on rules and values being upheld internationally.  Discrepancies between our domestic and
international  conduct  on  issues  such  as  climate  change  and  human  rights  not  only  exposes  us  to
accusations of hypocrisy on the world stage but also weaken the institutions and values essential to the
UK’s interests.'' (The World In 2024: Renewing The UK's Approach To International Affairs by Tom
Fletcher, Moazzam Malik and Mark Sedwill). The UK Policy Lab conference proclaimed that Britain
must  abolish  the  Foreign  Office  and  establish  in  its  place  a  Department  for  International  Affairs
because the present office symbolizes the nation's evil past of promoting capitalism and establishing
colonial liberation of animal hordes ruled by tribes, castes, kings and clans. It proclaimed that pictures
of colonial liberation are pictures of oppression and exploitation of noble savages and must be removed
from the halls of the government. It proclaimed that the notion of freedom is elitist and rooted in the
past and must be the replaced progressive, populist, modernist notion of socialism and service to the
state. It proclaimed that the notion of socialism and service to the state alone can establish an open
culture  and ensure that  Britain  prospers  in  the future:  ''A new brand would help  signal  a  forward
looking ambition for the twenty first century. The very name of the Foreign, Commonwealth (formerly
‘Colonial’) and Development Office is anchored in the past. A new Department for International Affairs
(or Global Affairs UK) would signal a potentially quite different role. The physical surroundings on
King Charles Street also hint at the Foreign Office’s identity: somewhat elitist and rooted in the past.
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Modernizing premises–perhaps with fewer colonial era pictures on the walls–might help create a more
open working culture and send a clear signal about Britain’s future.'' (The World In 2024: Renewing
The UK's Approach To International Affairs by Tom Fletcher, Moazzam Malik and Mark Sedwill). The
UK Policy Lab conference proclaimed that  Britain must  renounce its  traditions  and institutions of
freedom and transform itself into an international national lamb fattened for slaughter. It must renounce
all its wealth to finance the dismantling of civilization in the name of combating global climate change,
to finance the scum of the Earth in the name of humanitarian assistance, and to finance the arts and
culture of savage nations in the name of spreading soft power: ''The UK should set a broader spending
commitment for international engagement.  Currently,  the UK has spending commitments related to
defense (2% Gross Domestic Product) and aid (0.5% with an aspiration to meet 0.7% of Gross National
Income).  The  UK  would  be  better  served  by  having  a  more  flexible  spending  commitment  for
international  engagement  alongside  defense--potentially  1% of  GNI to  cover  planned international
spending  on  climate,  humanitarian,  development  and  soft  power  priorities  (with  exceptional
unforeseeable crisis spending in year handled beyond that).'' (The World In 2024: Renewing The UK's
Approach To International Affairs by Tom Fletcher, Moazzam Malik and Mark Sedwill). Master of a
global empire of freedom for five centuries, an empire in power and extent the world had never seen
before,  Britain  surrendered  its  freedom under  the  pressure  of  its  mobs  beginning in  the  twentieth
century. In the middle of the century, it surrendered its freedom to the welfare state. After World War II,
it  surrendered  its  freedom  to  the  decolonization  movement.  In  the  twenty  first  century,  it  has
surrendered its freedom to two monsters: to a regime of hate speech codes, political correctness and
nondiscrimination laws enforced by gender, race and class police; and to the conference of the UK
Policy Lab. The latter has delivered the coup de grace to the nation. It has abolished it, renamed it the
Department for International Affairs, and made it officially unrecognizable. 

OBJECT ONTOLOGY: A TECHNICAL TERM FOR SANITY

Jargon is the technical language associated with a particular field. It facilitates communication among
members of a field but its terms are often strange and unknown to outsiders. A leading philosopher of
the Enlightenment, Etienne Bonnot de Condillac, describes its proper function: ''Every science requires
a  special  language because  every science  has  its  own ideas.  It  seems that  one  ought  to  begin  by
composing this language, but people begin by speaking and writing, and the language remains to be
composed.'' (Commerce and Government In Relation To Each Other). In the field of philosophy, there
is a technical term which illustrates human sanity as nothing else in the field does. It illustrates the
common sense of those in possession of normal mental faculties as nothing else does. It illustrates the
proper functioning of the human mind as nothing else does. The term is  object ontology, and though it
appears difficult and intimidating to laypersons, its meaning is simple and understandable to all those
who enjoy sound mental health and well being. It is the doctrine that what exists outside the mind is
material particles, objects such as tables, rivers, stones and electrons, that these objects are as they are
and possess fixed natures and essences, and that properties such as color, motion, size and shape are the
properties of these primary objects and do not exist apart from them. The term stands for a truth which
is self evident to clear headed, civilized people, yet this truth has been denied by every major school of
philosophic thought in the West. Its truth was never held in doubt in Classical Culture, which was
guided by the spirit of Apollo, the spirit of reason, science and sanity, but in the Faustian culture of the
West, in the culture born among the ancient Germanic tribes in 1000 AD, centuries after the collapse of
ancient Rome, its truth has been brazenly denied. In the culture of the West, the culture of the sorcerer
Faust,  the  culture  of  will  power,  the  culture  of  romanticism,  the  culture  of  feeling,  sensation,
excitement and infinite, subjective experience, its truth has been held up to ridicule and consigned to a
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dustbin marked  failed ideas. Listen to the preeminent philosopher of Classical culture, the avatar of
Apollo as nobody else has been the avatar of Apollo, affirm that to perceive is to perceive something.
Listen to Aristotle affirm that perception is of physical objects or it is of nothing and does not exist.
Listen to him affirm that in the act of perception, the eye receives the form of the object without the
matter: ''The perceiver is potentially what the object actually is. When it is being affected, it is unlike
the object, but when it has been affected it has been made like the object and has acquired its quality A
general point to be grasped is that each sense receives the perceptible forms without the matter. Wax,
for instance, receives the design on a signet ring without the iron or gold; it acquires the design in the
gold or bronze, but not insofar as the design is gold or bronze.'' (On The Soul). Now fast forward the
clock of history by a millennium from the time of Aristotle and enter a jungle of raging insanity called
the West. It was born on the same continent as Classical culture but differs from it as midnight differs
from noonday and amorphous darkness differs from light defined clarity. Listen to the avatars of this
insanity and see a culture whose mental implosion has terrorized the world. Listen to the preeminent
philosopher of the West proclaim that since the power to perceive something necessarily exists prior to
any actual act of perception, all knowledge is acquired apriori. This prior power to perceive functions
as a screen and veil over the eyes which forever prevents them from perceiving reality: ''Since the
receptivity of the subject, its capacity to be affected by objects, must necessarily precede all actual
perceptions of these objects, it can readily be understood how the form of all appearances can be given
prior  to  all  actual  perceptions,  and  so  exist  in  the  mind apriori."  (Critique  Of  Pure  Reason by
Immanuel Kant). Listen to Immanuel Kant proclaim that all knowledge is acquired apriori and because
of this  is  necessarily purely subjective.  The traditional,  common sense view that  perception is  the
perception of something must be replaced by the view that perception creates its  own objects and
perception is the perception of nothing: ''Hitherto it has been assumed that all our knowledge must
conform to objects. But all attempts to extend our knowledge of objects by establishing something in
regard to them apriori have, on this assumption, ended in failure. We must therefore consider whether
we may not have more success in the tasks of metaphysics, if we suppose that objects must conform to
our knowledge.'' (Critique Of Pure Reason). Listen to Kant proclaim that true philosophy affirms that
what are called physical objects are universal delusions. It affirms that space and time do not exist
outside  the  mind  but  are  subjective  forms  of  perception.  It  affirms  that  the  world  which  exists
independently of our perception is supernatural and unperceivable: ''I understand by the doctrine of the
transcendental [apriori] subjectivism of all appearances, the doctrine that they are all together to be
regarded as mere representations and not things in themselves, and accordingly that time and space are
only subjective forms of perception, not determinations given for themselves or conditions of objects as
things  in  themselves.  To  this  subjectivism  is  opposed  realism,  which  regards  space  and  time  as
something given in themselves, independent of our perception.'' (Critique Of Pure Reason). Now fast
forward the clock of history from the time of Kant to the present day and see the end of the line of a
fearsome train which has sped and crashed into civilizational collapse. On board the train was G. W. F.
Hegel, who proclaimed that reality is Absolute Mind. On board was Karl Marx, who proclaimed that
reality is  pure material  change and becoming without  the existence of  anything which changes or
becomes. On board was pragmatism, which proclaimed that reality is plastic, indeterminate experience.
On board was phenomenology,  which proclaimed that  reality is  constituted of forms and essences
bracketed from all physical existence. On board was relativity theory in physics, which proclaimed that
reality is a pure field of force without the existence of anything which carries force. On board was
quantum theory in physics, which proclaimed that reality is constituted of physical objects which move
about by pure chance, and movement itself is an illusion; all socalled movement is ''quantized''; and is
created by a  rapid,  motion  picture type  succession  of  static  states.  On board was string theory in
physics, which proclaimed that reality is constituted of threadlike concentrations of energy without the
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existence  of  anything  which  possesses  energy and  moves.  On  board  was  Martin  Heidegger,  who
proclaimed that reality is the ''being there'' of the human will, a ''being there'' which is nowhere. On
board was Ludwig Wittgenstein, who proclaimed that reality is constituted of arbitrary and subjective
''language games''. On board was Jurgen Habermas, who proclaimed that reality is manufactured by
discourse, communication, deliberation and consensus. On board were philosophers in the twenty first
century alive at the time of the collapse, who proclaimed that the world of physical objects is nothing
more than an impression produced by the brain and has no reality. They proclaimed that the world of
physical  objects  is  a  neural  simulation.  They proclaimed that  the world  of  physical  objects  is  the
product of a stream of consciousness. They proclaimed that the world of physical objects is a figment
of the imagination. They proclaimed that the world of physical objects is the product of dreams floating
through space and what is called existence is pure nothingness: ''Now, let this X be the entire physical
universe and all physical things in it: all matter, energy, space, time, force, motion, and so on. The
whole shooting match. I put it to you that you cannot be sure that X is really there. Science fiction fans
will find this bit easy, and I must beg indulgence of those whose reading habits are more Chekhov than
Asimov. The starting point for the sci-fi fans is to imagine that your brain is floating in a glass vat. A
life support system pumps a supply of oxygen and glucose into the brain, and extracts waste matter
from the blood supply. A dense bank of electrodes connects the brain to a massive electronic computer.
Signals are transmitted into the brain to create the impression that the brain inhabits a body walking
around a three dimensional world. And other signals, which emanate from the brain’s motor cortex, are
picked up by the computer and used to simulate the movement of the virtual body in the virtual space.
So far this is fairly mundane, but now we must move from science fiction to science fantasy. The next
step  is  to  imagine  that  you do not  even have  a  brain:  that  you  are  just  a  disembodied  stream of
consciousness  floating  in  nothingness.  (Forgive  me  if  this  seems  puerile.  Philosophy  is  like  this
sometimes.)  Now  you  have  the  idea  of  the  whole  physical  world  (X)  being  a  figment  of  your
imagination. Here’s the crunch: How do you know this is not how things really are? How do you know
that you are not really a consciousness floating in a vacuum? 'Well, it’s not very likely, is it?', the reader
may reply in a harsh tone of voice. 'The chances of this science fantasy scenario being true must be
vanishingly small.' All I want you to do is to accept the possibility, not the probability: to agree that it
really is conceivable that you are just a stream of consciousness with no physical substrate. It doesn’t
matter that you regard this possibility as so unlikely that you would never seriously consider that it
might be true.'' (The Physical World Is A Fiction by Peter Lloyd). On board the train of civilizational
collapse  was  a  world  famous publication,  consulted  by mental  health  professionals  and university
faculties  throughout  the  world.  Published  by the  American  Psychiatric  Association,  it  was  called
the Diagnostic And Statistical Manual Of Mental Disorders. A section of the manual was opened by the
action of the crash. It contained the chapter on schizophrenia. It  defined this terrifying disorder as
follows: ''A psychotic disorder characterized by disturbances in thinking, emotional responsiveness and
behavior.  [It  includes]  delusions  and  hallucinations.''  Denying  that  physical  objects  exist  or  are
perceived or can be known with certainty to exist, Western philosophy has been a thousand year old
byword and synonym for this disorder. 
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